
---=-·-

, 
' • Palmer -page 9 

VOL. XIV, NO. 22 an independent student newspaper serving notre dame and saint mary's THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 27, 1979 

Ministry 
plans no 

Chicago trip 
by jim Soisson 

Although millions of people 
are exl?ected to see the Pope's 
mass m Chicago on Oct. 5, 
Notre Dame's Campus Ministry 
has no plans to organize a trip 
to the Windy City. 

"Our hands are tted, ' said 
Fr. William A. Toohey, director 
of Campus Ministry. ''To 
promote or organize something 
like that invites people to act 
contrary to the schedule of the 
day," he explained. 

Concerning the scheduled 
chartering of foor buses by the 
St. Mary's Spiritual Commis­
sion, Fr. Toohey said he had no 
knowledge of how they were 
going to coordinate the event 
with classes on Friday. 

The Notre Dame Skydiving 
Club sponsored an exhibition 
last t?vening at the Green Field. 
From left to n'ght are area 

Of Kenned_y 

·members jim Stahlman, Ron 
Wedge and john Kime com­
pleting their jumps from a 
height of 4000 feet. A fourth 

parachutist, Larry Nensttez, 
also made the jump but missed 
the target area. fphotos by Tom 
Jackman). 

''The students are handling it 
on an individual basis,'' ex­
plained Mary D. Ryan, spiritual 
commissioner and coordinator 
of the chartered bus trip. 

Carter haults verbal assault 
A survey was sent out earlier 

to St. Mary's students which 
included a question about inter­
est in such a trip. "The 
response was overwhelming, 
said Ryan, "that is why we 
went ahead with it.'' 

(continued on page 11 ) 

W JI.SHINGTON (AP) - Pres­
dent Carter called a brief 
cease-fire yesterday in his step­
ped up verbal assault on Sen. 
Edward Kennedy to send his 
potential rival a note saying 
remarks he made in New York 
were ont intPnrled as a refer­
ence toChappaquiddick. 

Student breaks back 
in fall during panty raid 

by Molly Woulfe 
Senior Staff Reporter 

A Notre- Dame freshman 
crushed several vertebrae in 
his back last night in a fall from 

"'a second-story window ledge of 
Regina South, during the trad­
itional Saint Mary's pre-home 
game panty raid. Ken Ohishi, a 
resident of Saint Ed's Hall, will 
remain in Memorial Hospital 
for the next few days for 
observation. He is listed in 
satisfactory condition. 
Ohishi had climbed to the 

ledge and ''was talking to the 
girls in the room when I came in 
and told him it was time to get 
down," related Carol Trous­
dale, an R. A. in Regina. "He 
turned his head, looked down, 
and apparently decided to 
jump, but landed on his back. 
Seemg he was in obvious pain, 
two ND men, realizing he had 
possibly hurt his back, pinned 
him down so he couldn't 
move.'' Students then notified 
SMC Security of the accident, 
who contacted Memorial Hos­
pital. An ambulanve arrived 
~!~bin ten minutes, and para­
medics fitted Ohishi with a neck 
brace and transported him to 
the_,~mergency room for X-rays. 

His . parents were contacted 

upon his admittance into the 
hospital. 

Trousdale that students part­
aking ir, t~e raid were not 
unrulier that. previous crowds, 
but "a lot more irresponsible. 
This was a visible acctdent, and 
only two students came to his 
aid. The rest continued to 
climb up the walls, while all this 
was going on.'' She added that 
a few 01:her ''obviously intoxica­
ted" students managed to 
climb up onto the hall roof, but 

'He turned his head, 

looked down. and 
apparently decided 
to jun1p, but landed 
on h1s back.' 

were -escorted down. 
SMC Security agreed that the 

300-odd students who participa­
ted in the annual raid were "no 
bigger problem than in previ­
ous years,'' and otherinctdents 
only involved screens tossed 
from dormitory windows , and 
trampled shrubs. Half a dozen 
Security officers were on duty, 
in patrol cars and on foot, 
during the raid. 

In the hand-written note, 
Carter said his statement Tues­
day night at a "twon meetin" in 
Queens had been "grossly ex­
aggerated by the press 

· Asked by reporters about the 
note, Kennedy said he did not 
consider it an apology but 
added, ''I was just glad to get 
it.'' 
· 'Carter had told the audience 
in Queens that as president he 
had to deal with several crises 
and "I don't think I panicked." 

White House .{>tess secretary 
J ody Powell satd Carter had 
sent the note after reading "er­
roneous press reports saying 
his comments were a veiled 
reference to Chappaquiddick.'' 

White House aids in the past 
have said that ifKennnedy does 
challenge Carter for the 1980 
Democratic nomination, Carter 
would not make an issue of 
Kennedy's reaction to crisis 
conditions when he drove a car 
off a bridge at Chappaquiddick 
in $969, resulting in the death 
of Mary J o 'Kopec .. de 

Kennedy told reporters, "I 
appreciate his sending it (the 
note) to me, and were I to be a 
candidate I'd be talking about 
the issues which are most in the 
minds of the American people 
and I think that's also what he'd 
want.'' 

Kennedy's comments came 
at a poolside appearance pre­
ceding a $1,000-a-plate dinner 
sponsored by the Democratic 
National Committee. 

Carter was the featured 
speaker at the dinner, which 
Kennedy did not stay to 
attend. 

With Kennedy showing every 
sign of moving steadily towards 
a presidential bid, he and 
Car.er have been sounding 
more and more like rival 
.:andidates. 

At the Queens town meeting, 
Carter also questioned whether 
Kennedy would fare any better 
with Congress than Carter has. 

"Sen. Kennedy has been in 
Congress for 16 years," said 
Carter. "His major premise, 
his major goal, has been to 
establish a comprehensive na­
tional health insurance policy ... 
He has never gotten a com­
prehensive national health bill 
out of his subcommittee. It is 
not easy.'' 

Kennedy was in Washington 
speaking to the National Asso­
ciation of Black ] ournalists and 
he repeated his criticism of 
Carter's energy policies: 

"He does not have to send 
the cost of crude oil through the 
roof by abandoning price con­
trols," the senator said. "The 
OPEC nations have the 'power 
to fix the price of American oil 
as well at a time when inflation 
is already running 13 percent 
here at home? 

In a remark widely interpret­
ed as a reference to the 
(\happaquiddick incident, Car­
ret said, "We've had some 
crises where it required a 
steady hand, a careful and 
deliberate decision to be made. 
I don't think I panicked in the 
crises." 

Carter aides have said the 
president would not raise as an 
issue Kennedy's reaction to 
crisis conditions when he drove 
a car off a bridge at Chappa­
quiddick in 1969 resulting in the 
death of Mary J o Kopechne. 

When asked about Carter's 
oblique reference to the in­
cident, Kennedy said he did not 
believe Chappaquiddick would 
be a decisive issue in the 1980 
campatgn. 

"I think the real issues in 
1980 are economic issues - the 
rate of inflation, rising unem­
ployment and energy,'' the 
senator said. 

Asked about the recent em­
phasis from the White House on 
character and the ability to act 
calmly in c.dsis conditions, Ken-

[conttnued on page 2.] 

Electric car· 

receives mixed 

responses 
Although it received a banner 

headline in the Chicago Trib­
une, the electricpowered vehic­
le proposed this week by the 
General Motors Corporation 
has received mixed reviews in 
South Bend too. 
Interest in the gasless car was 

renewed on Tuesday when the 
number-one automaker an­
nounced a major advancement 
in its battery research ; the de­
velopment ot a zinc-n.ckel-ox­
ide battery. 
With its new battery, GM 

hopes to build an electric car 
that will travel 50 to 55 miles 
per hour, go 100 miles before 
needing recharging, and will 
operate for 30,000 miles before 
the battery must be replaced. 
Designed to be a supplement 

and not a replacement for the 
gas powered automobile, the 
electric car is planned for use as 
an urban commuter utility ve­
hicle. 
Development of the zinc-nic­

.kel-oxide battery overcomes 
one of the major obstacles of 
producing electric vehicles. 
The new battery is one third 
lighter, takes up less space and 
has a longer life than the 
conventional lead-acid battery 
used to help start gas-powered 
cars. 
However, Dr. James Taylor, 

chairman of the civil engineer­
ing dept., believes that the 
lighter electric car may be as 
much a highway safety problem 
as a technological improve­
ment. 
According to Taylor, lighter 

cars just don't offer the protect­
ion of heavier cars. He added 
that numerous -;tudies and a lot 
of statistics show a strong 
inverse relationship between a 
car's weight and htghway fatal­
ities. 
In addition to the weight 

question, Taylor is skeptical of 
the safety of having a large 
battery unit directly behind the 
passengers in the new cars, 
which are designed for two 
passengers. 

"Another concern," Taylor 
said, "is that we have a huge 
system built up to take care of 
gas-powered cars, but we don't 
have any servicing outlets for 
electrical vehicles now or any 
planned in the future.'' 

More importantly, the devel­
opment of tooling to mass 
produce the battery, refine­
ments in the motor technology, 
experimental cars for more 
tests and then developing tool­
ing for mass production of the 
vehicle is needed before mar­
keting it, explained marketing 
professor John Malone. 
Predicting long commercial 

development for electric cars, 
Malone said it would be opt- , 
imistic but not impossible for 
the vehicle to be m the show 
rooms by 1985. 

Malone pointed out, that, in 

(conttnued on page 11 l 



News in brief 
Carter explores options 
in Soviet- Cuban crisis 
WASHINGTON (AP) - Presi­
dent Carter, searching for a 
resolution of the dispute over 
Russian troops in Cuba, has 
convened a panel of U.S. intell­
isence experts to offer sugges­
tiOns on the problem, a White 
House official said last night. 
The group reportedly began 

evaluating the situation 
Tuesday at the CIA's head­
quarters in Lansley, Va. Other 
U.S. sources said at the United 
Nations earlier yesterday that 
Carter may personally step into 
the flagging U.S.-Soviet nego­
tiations over the Russian troops 
in Cuha. 

IRS co~fiscates Isle_y Bros. ' 
properties _for back taxes 

ARMONK, N.Y. (AP)- The 
Internal Revenue Service has 
seized a $400,000 home owned 
by Christopher Jasper, a mem­
ber of the Isley Brothers rock 
group, because of unpaid taxes. 
The spokesman said the IRS 
wnfiscated the home because 
of unpaid back taxes for 1977 
tot~ling $1')0,7'iQ Last month, 

the IRS also confiscated proper­
ty owned by the Isley Brothers 
group, including the Northern 
Westchester Health Club and 
the Pepper Tree Restaurant in 
Mount Kisco. Holmes said the 
IRS also seized several homes 
owned by members of the band 
in New] ersey. 

Fonda urRes orRanization 
1o(female office workers 
NEW YORK (AP) - Actress 
.Jane Fonda says the time has 
come for female office workers 
to organize and defend their 
ri~hts because, she says, they 
wdl suffer the most in the 
1980s. Speaking before some 
800 office workers, most of 

Weather 

them . ·omen, the actress warn­
ed they may be called names if 
they buck the tide of low pay 
and other oppression. "But 
that's all right, because history 
will prove you are right,'' she 
declared. 

Sunny and mild today and fair Partlv sunny Friday, High in 
and mild tonif.ht. High today in the low 80s. Low friday night in 
the low 80s. ,ow tonight in the the mid ';Os. 
mid ')Os. 

( am-4 pm 

4·1~ pm 

4:30pm 

6:30pm 

6:30pm 

8 pm 

8 pm 

8 pm 

9 pm 

9 pm 

.. 

ACADEMIC APPAREL SALE, 
for all faculty, ND BOOK­
STORE 

MEETING, accounting intern­
ship question and answers, 
sponsored by beta alpha psi, 
124 HAYES-HEALY 

LECTURE, "synthesis, struc­
ture, and reactivity of sandwich 
and tripledecker complexes,'' 
dr. walter sieber, u. of 
marburg, w. ~ermany, spon­
sored by chemistry dept., 123 
NIEULAND 

MEETING, leadership training 
class, sponsored by campus 
crusade for Christ, BULLA 
SHED 

MEETING, junior advisory 
council, B-P PUZZLE ROOM 

MEETING, new jersey club, 
LIT'ILE THEATRE OF LA 
FORTUNE 

MEETING, junior parent's 
weekend organizing committee, 
all juniors interested should 
attend, LA FORTUNE 
BALLROOM 

PEP RALLY, "kick off pep 
rally," irish coaches, co-cap­
tains, cheerleaders, and spectal 
guests, DILLON I ALUMNI 
COURTYARD 

OPEN STAGE, sign in at 9 pm, 
NAZZ 

MEETING, ohio farmworkers. 
support committee, LA 
FORTUNE BALLROOM 

~ ;t,'\.· ... ,.· ... ;~ ... • .. -~-.~. ~··· .. •• ,· , 

(continued from page 5] 

park, Smith explained. 
"I don't want to be an 

alarmist," Gilbert said, "but 
we don't know what those 
effects are. " 

The Union for Concerned 
Scientists believes that cancer 
and leukemia deaths as well as 
~enetic defects are on the rise 
m this countrl on account of the 
profusion o nuclear power 
plants. 

On the other hand, there r.r~ 
numerous scientists who dis­
agree with such views. Profes­
sor ] ohn Lucey of the ND 
Engineering Department pre­
sents several valid points in 
favor of the construction of 
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• • . Nuclear plant 
Bailly I. 

Unlike the Michigan plants, 
Indiana law will require cooling 
towers at Bailly I, he said, 
adding that this feature will 
almost eliminate danger to the 
environment. 

Proponents of the 660 mega­
watt plant have also been 
accused of not providing a 
practical evacuation plan for the 
neighboring area. Lucey stated 
that although a plan has to be 
submitted to the Nuclear Regu­
latory Commission before 
licensing, it has never been 
necessary to prove its effective­
ness. 

To put such a plan into 
practice could cause a real 
panic, Lucey remarked. 

• • . Carter 

In 1974, Bailly Alliance 
brought a suit before the 
Supreme Court testing the 
evacuation site ruling of the 
NRC. The case was settled in 
favor of NIPSCO. 

Another suit was brought 
befort· the Supreme Court in 
1976. This concerned a law that 
prohibits construction of power 
plants close to natural re­
sources. The Bailly I plant is 
close to the Indiana Dunes State 
Park. This suit too was 
overturned and construction 
was okayed. 

Lucey also pointed out that in 
theory, a nuclear power plant 
produces less accidental radia­
tion than the type of coal 
burning station now operating 
at Bailly. 

----·-----

Coal contains amounts of 
thorium and uranium both of 
which are radioactive minerals. 
At coal-burning plants there is 
little provision to prevent radio­
activity from escaping, Lucey 
explained. 

lcontmued from page 1.) 

nedy replied, "people can draw 
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whatever inferences they will.'' 
Meanwhile, Sen. EdmundS. 

Muskie, D-Maine, told report­
ers at a breakfast meeting on 
Tuesday that he hopes the 1980 
campaign doesn't get off to roo 
early a start, further undercut­
ting Carter's ability to get 
support for his programs on 
Capitol Hill. 

''The best course for the 
Democrats is for the president 
to maintain his political viability 
as long as he can,'' said 
muskie. 

Work on Bailly I was begun 
in order to supl'ly energy for 
the Gary area mdustrial net­
work. It would help alleviate 
the rising cost of rower for 
NIPSCO's residentia subscrib­
ers, according to Lucey. He 
added that cancellation of the 
project would mean a rise in the 
price of electricity to local 
consumers as well as more 
expensive steel products 
nationwide if the steel mills are 
f<;>rced to rely on more expen­
sive energy sources. 
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Speakers discuss; w-om.en's careers 
by Mary Kay Leydon 

College to Career Days con­
tinued last night at Saint 
Mary's with five guest speakers 
from various professions. 

Mary Ellen Rusinik, a recent 
graduate of Saint Mary's, is the 
fiscal officer for the Board of 
Public Works in South Bend. 
During colle~e, she held an 
internship wah the Personnel 
Department of the City of South 
Bend. After graduation she 
received the position with the 
Mayor's office. Within a year, 
Rusinik was promoted to the 
position she now holds. 

Rusinik is fascinated by city 
government and said that she 
believes the opportunities for 
women in this type of job are 
expanding. She is the first 
woman to ever hold her posi­
tion. She said that the idea of 
entering politics is "tempting." 

Ms. Jan Farron is a sales 
representative for W estco, a 
subdivision of Westinghouse 
Electric. She has held vvo"u'""" 

in sales since her graduation 
from Eastern Michigan Univer­
sity. F arron atcknowledged that 
there are not many women 
employed in executive positions 
at Westin~house, but stressed 
that there 1s room for women in 
these types of jobs. "There's 
always room 1to move up,'' she 
said. 

Mrs. Posi Tucker is a high 
school counsellor as well as a 
part time sponscaster. She is 
also the mother of four 
children. 
Combinin~~ these three 

careers is the toughest/art of 
working and Tucker sai it can 
only be achieved by ''sharing 
the responsibilities of the house 
with my husband and the 
kids." 

Tucker has a degree in 
elementary education from 
Indiana University and a 
Masters Degree in the field of 
guidance and counselling from 
the same institution. Tucker 
said that "my job as counselor 
is the most imponant." 

Notre Dame's Bill Murphy an open-net goal by freshman 
beats l;(ala"!azoo goalie Lincoln Mark. Luetk.el.ians. See story 
McBrzdy wzth a set-up pass for 

Opponunities for women on 
both these jobs are growing, 
she said. ''The opponunities 
are there, it's a matter of being 
at the right place at the right 
time." 

Lois Kress is the personnel 
director for the Coopers & 
Lybrand public accounting 
firm's South Bend office. She 
recruits college graduates to 
work in various positions in the 
firm. 

Going to different campuses, 
Kress interviews the ''top 
notch'' students interested in 
public accounting. 

"For an intelligent woman 
with a desire to work hard, the 
opportunities in accountin~ are 
great," Kress said. "The mter­
view may be the most imponant 
part of your applications. Being 
prepared for interviews of any 
kind is very imJ?ortant.'' 

Mina Costin ts another grad­
uate of SMC. After graduation, 
she attended Columbia Gradu-

[continued on page 6.] 
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SMC cancels Plastic Hymie Band 
appearance at senior picnic 

by john McGrath 
Senior Staff Reporter 

What would have undoubt­
edly proved to be an interesting 
sideltght to this afternoon's 
senior picnic at Saint Mary's 
~as abruptly cancelled Tuesday 
mght. ''The Plastic Hymie 
Band,'' a five-member musical 
group headed by controversial 
campus figure Michael "Hy­
mie" Heaney, was scheduled to 
perform at the picnic but 
according to Heany, plan~ were 
shelved after opposition to the 
concert arose among Saint 
Mary's students. 

'Tm very dissappointed," 
Heaney told The Observer last 
night. "I don't think that they 
(ptcnic officials) realize how 
much time we put into prepar­
ing for this.'' 

The controversy started sev­
eral weeks ago when· Notre 
Dame Senior Class President 
Nick Schneeman invited Heaney 
a~d ~is group to perform for the 
ptcmc. 

"We've had a couple of 
picnics this year so far. and 

they've gone really well, so we 
decided we wanted music for 
this one," Scheeman recalled. 
''I heard Hymie sing before, 
and '1 thought he did a really 
good parody of life at Notre 
Dame, so I asked him if he 
would get the band together 
and provide music for the 
picnic." 

Joan Winter, Saint Mary's 
senior class treasurer, acknow­
ledged that there was some 
apprehension among Saint 
Mary's students about the nat­
ure of the concert. Heaney, an 
unsuccessful candidate in last 
year's student body president 
election, has in the past stirred 
controversy on both campuses 
in reaction to the satirical lyrics 
of his music. 

"I don't think it (the concert) 
would have offended the major­
ity of them (Saint Mary's 
students), but seeing that it 
(the picnic) is a Saint Mary's 
funcuon, we decided not to take 
the chance," Winter explain­
ed. "A few people might have 
taken it (satirical lyrics) to 
heart, so rather than risk that, 
we decided not to have him." 

Heaney explained that the 
content of his concert would 
have been modeled after a 
similar event held last spring. 

"I think my track record 
would indicate that my per­
formances are very popular,'' 
Heaney said. "We certainly 
were not planning on being 
rude or offensive.'' 

Schneeman informed mem­
bers of Saint Mary's student 
government of his plans to 
invite Heaney, but after discus­
sing- the matter with them, he 
agreed that the concert should 
be dropped. 

''I thought it was fair to warn 
the SMC people, and I told 
them that there would be 
nothing vulgar, nothing ob­
scene," Scheeman said. But · 
they decided that it was better 
not to have the concert.'' 

"If they didn't want us to 
play, that was one thing, but I 
think they should have told us a 
lot sooner (that the concen 
would be cancelled),'' Heaney 
commented. ''The ultimate 
losers are the people who have 
clamored for the PlasticHymie 
!Band to play at SMC.'' 
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I YOU BETTER BELIEVE THE BIRD WHEN IT SAYS O'HANLON'S HAS 
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! HEEP HE P HEEP 
BEER! WI E! LIQUOR! 
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• 

HUGE SELECTIONS OF FAIOUS BRAIDS ••• ALL DISCOUNT PRICED! 
~ BEER VALUES: UQUERS & BUNDY SCOTCH 

A-IJ LIGHT --------12/12 cans 13.59 CORDIALS CHRISTIAN BROS.qt. 6.69 1.75 112.79 GLENLIVET -----------5th '15.59 
BUSCH ---------------loose '6.89 : REMY ·MARTIN V.S. ____ 5th 115.89 TEACHER'S ------------ qt. S9.S9 
BUD----------------- loose '6.89 HIRAM WALKER: COURVOISIER V.S. ----5th 112.79 CAITO'S -qt. ... '6.19 L1.75 '11.71'. 
BLATZ ________ 12112 no return '2.89 PEPPERMINT SCHNAPPSqt.'4.69 MARTELL V.S. O.P. ----5th '14.49 JOHNNIE WALKER RED --Qt. '9 •• 
MICHELOB------ 4t6 no return 11.99 FLAVORED BRANDIES-- Qt.'5.39 MEISTER BRAND ______ 5th '10.69 BLACK --------------Qt. 

1
13.89 

Light 4t6 no return -------'1.99 AMARETTO ------------ Qt.'6.69 HENNESSY V.S. -------5th '11.98 J & B --------- 1·75 '18.39 qt.'9.99 
MILLER __________ 12;12 cans '3.51 CREME DE MENTH _____ qt.'4.89 METAXA 5-STAR -------5th '9.29 CHIVAS REGAL 1.75'26.79 5th'11.59 

12112 no return ---------'3.51 TRIPLE SEC ----------- Qt.14.89 CALVADOS -----------5th 111.49 BULLOCH & LADES -----Qt. '7.39 
MILLER LITE----- 12112 cans '3.69 SLOE GIN ------------- Qt.'5.09 PAUL MASSON --------5th 15.79 PINSCH----------------- 5th '9.99 

12112 no return ---------'3.69 AMARETTO & COGNAC. 5thS5.98 KORBEL--------------- 5th S5.29 PA SPORT -1·75 · · · '11.29 CJt. '6.19 
HEINEKEN LIGHT4t6 no return '3.89 TIA MARIA _____________ 5th '8.69 ALMADEN -------------5th '4.98 CUTTY SARK -- 1·75'18•09 qt'10.29 
FALUAFF ----------- loose '5.79 DRAMBUIE ____________ sth '10.99 ~~~~=~~;;LER -;1·---- qy. '6.19 
OLD MILWAUKEE ---- loose '5.98 GRAND MARNIER -----5th '13.49 TEQUILA USHERS 1.75 .. '101.4699 qt. '5'6.59 
PABS

,. ,
5 49 KAHLUA sth '7 89 ---1.75 · · . • qt. .39 

. -------------- loose . ---------------
1 

• ARANDAS WHITE------- qt. '5.59 DEW '3.29 AMARETTO D1 SARANN05th 10 69 AR'S --1.75 · · . '17.89 qt. '9.99 
L~1ht 12112 cans_________ 

1 
• MONTE ALBAN MEZCAL 5th '9.69 GR 

STROHS ,... 79 BENEDICTINE 5th 11 49 ANT'S --------- Qt .... '10.49 
·------------ loose u. --------- 1 · CUERVO WHITE ---------Qt. '6.79 

Light 12112 cans--------- '4.19 GALLIANO------------ 5th 10.79 
SCHLITZ _____________ loose '6.69 MANDARINE NAPOLEAN5th '10.99 RUM CANADIAN 

WHISKEY 
Light 12112 cans--------- 13.89 COINTREAU -----------5th '9.29 BACARDI --- 1.75 .. '10.39 qt. '5.69 
MaH 4t6 cans----------- 11.79 COCO RIBE ____________ 5th S6.59 BACARDI 151 o __________ qt. 18.39 

OLYMPIA------------ loose '6.98 CAFE LOLITA---------- 5th '5.39 APPLETON WHITE------ 5th '6.59 
CANADIAN CLUB 1.75114.81 qt'7.98 
CANADIAN LTD -1.75110.09 qt.'5.39 
MACNAUGHTON --~---- qt. '6.09 

Gold 12112 cans--------- 13.69 PERNOD--------------- 5th '6.99 LEMON HART DEMERARA5th 16.49 
HAMM'S ------------- loose '6.49 CAMPARI ______________ sth '7.29 

OLD STYLE ---12/12 no returns 13.98 SOUTHERN COMFORT-- qt. '7.39 BOURBON 
WALKER'S -- 1.75 ... '9.79 qt. '6.09 LOWENBRAU ____ 416 no return '2.59 IRISH MIST------------ 5thS10.19wALKER'S DELUXE _____ qt. '6.29 
WINDSOR--1.75 ... '10.98 at. '5.79 

MOLSON'S ALE - 4t6 no return '2.39 
CHAMPALE WHITE -----614 '1.69 
RED, WHITE & BLUE --loose '5.69 
WEIDEMAN ---------- loose '5.29 
GROLSCH SWING -------- '1.19 

BOGGS CRANBERRY ---litre '9.89 ANCIENT AGE '6 09 
·yuKON JACK---------- 5th '6.49 OLD FORESTER=====-;6: ~:: '7:19 
MOLINARI SAMBUCA ---5th '8.59 --------------------100" qt. '9.19 
METAXA OUZO -------- sth '8.19 BARCLAY'S. -------------Qt. 14.99 
CARAMELLA -----------5th '5.49 OLD GRAND DAD--- 86" qt. 17.79 

CROWN ROYAL 1.75'22.98 5th'9.98 
v.o. ----------- 1.75114.79 qt. 17.98 
LORD CALVERT -1.75111.29 qt1 5.99 
CANADIAN MIST 1.75110.89 qt1 5.89 

RETURNABLES: 
BUSCH ___ -- ____________ _ 

BUD---------------------
BRAUMEISTER ----------­
FALSTAFF---------------
FOX----_---_----- __ --- __ 
HUBER-----------------­
MILLER-----------------­
MILLER LITE------------­
OLD MILWAUKEE --------
PABST ------------------
PFEIFFER __ ---- ____ ------
RHINELANDER-----------
STROH'S _____ - ----------

QUARTS: 
BUSCH------------------
BUD---------------------
COLT 45---------------.,.-
BLATZ----~--------------
FALSTAFF r---------------
MILLER ---·-- __ ;_ ___ -------
OLYMPIA·----·----------
PABST -~·---------------
SCHLITZ. ___ -- .. ----------
STROH'S ---------------­
OLD ENGLISH 800 ------­
LITTLE KINGS ----------­
BIG JUG-----------------

MARASKA SLIVOVITZ ___ 5th '7.69 TEN HIGH --1.75 ... '9.49 qt. '5.19 
CHAMPAGNES: STREAGA------------- 5tn 110.99 JIM BEAM------------ 1.75 '9.98 

'7.89 CHARTREUSE--------- 5th '11.49 -----------------------qt. '5.69 
'7.89 GRANDTULLY ---------- 5th '5.99 -------------: ________ gal. '21.89 ANDRE---------------- 5th '2.29 
'4.39 LOCHAN ORA--------- 5th '12.29 JACK DANIELS -------- 5th '8.49 JACQUES BONET ------5th '2.29 
'6.29 PETER HERRING------- 5th '8.59 EARLY TIMES1.75 .. '11.19 qt. '5.98 MARTINI & ROSSI ASTL 5th '8.09 
'4.39 FRANGELICI ---------- 5th ,11.19 MATTINGLY & MOORE 1.75 ~9.69 TAYLOR EX-DRY ------- 5th '5.09 
'4.59 WILD TURKEY LIQUEOR5th '12.79 ------------------;---- qt. ,4·89 PAUL MASSON --------5th '6.39 
'7.89 BOLS BLUE CURACAO _ qt. '5.49 ANTIQUE--- 1 75· - · 10·89 qt. ,5·59 CHRISTIAN BROS. ______ 5th '5.39 
'6.89 ARAK RAZZOUK ------- 5th '8.59 WILK TURKY -------- 86" 5th 7.29 LANSON FRENCH------ 5th '9.69 
'6.49 GIN MOET WHITE STAR ---5th 111.49 
15.39 VODKA MUMMS BRUT-------- 5th 113.39 

'4.59 
14.59 
'6.69 

c-
17.99 
17.99 
17.79 
'6.29 
16.98 
'8.23 
17.98 
16.52 
'9.49 
'7.95 
17.99 
'6.98 
'7.49 

STOLICHNAYA ---------5th '8.69 WALKER'S -- 1 75 ... '9.59 qt. 14.99 
KAMCHATKA_ 1.75 .. S7.89 qt. S4.19 GILBEY'S --1.75 ... 110.29 qt. '5.49 WINES 
DARK EYE FLAVORED-- 5th 14.29 TANQUERAYu5 · - · '15·49 qt. '8·59 1500 different types to choose from: 
SMIRNOFF __________ 100" qt '6.89 BOMBAY -'------------- Hr. :S-09 

BELLOWS _____________ 1.75 8.29 BLUE NUN _______ ; _____ 5th 14.89 
so· qt. -----------------·- '5.79 
so·, 1.75 ----------------- 110.69 

DARK EYES ------- so· 1.75 '8.59 
-----------------,--- so· qt_ '4.59 
---- 100" qt. ... 15.39 100" 1.75 '9.99 
CROWN RUSSEu5 ... '8.29 qt. '4.29 
GORDON'S __ 1.75 ... '8.79 qt. '4.39 
WOLFSCHMIDT1.75 ... '9.39 qt. '5.09 
POPOV------- 1.75 ... '8.69 qt. '4.49 

CALVERT'S ----------- 1.75 ::·:: MATEUS--------------- 5th S3.49 
ii.eisc.:tili'AN'N-·s·:====-1~7ts9:98 LANCERs ______________ 5th '3.89 

----------------------- qt. '5.39 KELLER GEISTER ------5th '2.49 
BEEFEATER --------- 1.75 $14.79 REAl SANGRIA -------- qt. '2.99 
----------------------- qt. '8.29 YAGO SANT GRIA ______ 5th '2.79 
BOOTH'S ------------ u5 $10.59 RICHARDS WILD IRISH _5th '1.59 
GORDON'S -1.75 ... '9.98 qt. '5.39 MOGAN DAVID CONCORD5th '2.09 
SEAGRAM'S1.75 ... '10.39 qt. 15.59 T.J. SWANN------------ 5th 11.69 

BOONES FARM --------5th '1.69 
BLENDED BOLLA ----------------5th '3.39 
WHISKEY CRISTA BELLA--------- 5th '2.69 

~~o ..... CHERRY KIJAFA -------5th '4.49 
IEEIIEIS .. -Miller------------- $21.00 

Miller LHe-------------­
PabsL------------ $20.50 
Strohs ------------$20.50 
Busch -----------------
Budwel•r -----·--- $20.50 
Mlchelob---------- $22.00 
Hefnekens -------------

$33.50 CALVERT --1.75 ... 111.29 qt. '6.09 GIACOBAZZI LAMBRUSCO '2.49 
:::: SEAGRAM'S1.75. - . S11.39 qt. $6.19 .RIUNITE LAMBRUSCO --5th '2.39 
$32.50 PHILADELPHIA 1.75 . '8.98 qt. '4.89 CELLA LAMBRUSCO ____ 5th '2.29 
$31.00 KESSLER'S 1.75 ... '10.19 qt. '5.49 MEDICI L4MBRUSCO ---5th '2.39 
:::::: P.M. DELUXE1.75 ... '8.89 qt. '4.69 ZONIN LAMBRUSCO ____ 5th '2.19 
$69.00 IMPERIAL--1.75 ... '9.59 qt. 15.49 CHATEAU LASALLE ----5th '2.49 

Li'l Cheaper says, "WE'RE CHEAP" ••• ask our competition! __ ..... ........_ 

PRICES GOOD AT BOTH STORES: 

• 1935 Lincolnway East, So. Bend 287-28&1 

• 4401 Western Ave., So. Bend 282-2844 

.John f. O'Hanlon Class of 65 ~ ru t979 o·nANI.ON'S INc 

EVERYPA Y LOW PRICES . . • UNLIMITED QUANTITIES! HOURS: lon. thru S1t. 9 to !I PLEITY OF FREE PIIIIIC 

Pricv<> subj<:'-1 to chang<: 
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jerry ]acobztz, a senior from 
Cavanaugh Hall, plays the 
Sacred Heart Church bells each 
weekday afternoon after 

ascendtng the church's ancient 
218 {oo.t tower. [photo by Tom 
jaclcman]. 

Anti -nuclear activists 
attempt disruption 
VERNON,Vt. (AP)- Anti­

nuclear activists intent on dis­
rupting work at the Vermont 
Yankee nuclear power plant sat 
down silently in a circle to block 
the plant's b~bed-wire gates 
yesterday. Thirty-three pro­
testers were arrested. 
The demonstration was the 

second sudl protest in this tiny 
southern Vermont community 
in fo\lr days .. On Sunday, 167 
demonstrators were arrested. 
The Vermont Yankee Decom­

missioning Alliance; a coalition 
of groups calling for the per­
manent shutdown of rhe plant; 
has promised repeated "non­
violent direct actions" to dis-

Communi~'Y 
plans 
_fall_fair 

Plans are underway for the 
Fall, Community Fair to be held 
on Saturday, September 29, at 
University Park Mall in Misha­
waka. 
Michiana's newest shopping 

center is sponsoring the event 
to provide local non-profit clubs 
and groups with a way to 
generate income in suppon of 
their organization's activities 
and to allow Michiana shoppers 
the opportunity to purchase 
handcrafted or specialttems not 
generally available. 
As good neighbors in the M:ich­

iana Community, the members 
of the University park Merch­
ants Association welcome all 
interested non-.Profit groups in­
cluding soronties, service 
clubs, churches, and schools to 
panicipate in the Community 
Fair event. 
Groups interested in panicipa­

ting should contact the Mall 
Office by calling 277-2223. 

rupt the reactor's annual re­
fueline-. 

Protesters voluntarily accom­
panied police to waiting buses 
yesterday, and John W arshow, 
an alliance leader, said the 
demonstrators went along with 
police because they felt they 
had placed ''enough strain on 
police." On Sunday, demon­
strators had to be carried to 
buses. 
Officials said those arrested 

were taken to a nearby armory 
to be held pen<;ling arraign­
ment. 
Nearly ~0 protesters marched 

to the plant gate singing "We 
Shall Overcome,'' and most of 
the group then sat down in front 
of the gates. The others left, 
apparently to avoid arrest. 

A police spokesman read a 
warning to the group before 
officers began arresting the 
protesters. 

Com~mittee 

invites 

attet.~dance 

The Ohio Farmworker 
Suppon Committee (a suppon 
group of FLOC, the Farm Labor 
Organizing Committee) will 
meet Thursday, September 27, 
at 9:00 p.m. 10 the LaFortune 
Ballroom. Any interested 
students, faculty .or staff are 
welcome to come hear an 
update of the situation in Ohio, 
recent developments, summer 
activity, and plans and 
strategtes for the future, in 
addition to general discussion 
of the issues and committee 
work in Solllth Bend and Notre 
Dame. 
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Indiana group fights building 
of NIPSCO's nuclear power plant 

by Sal Granata 

An Indiana special interest 
group is continuing to fight 
construction of nuclear power 
plants along Lake Michigan's 
South Shore. The Bailly 
Alliance proposed to stop the 
Bailly Nuclear I Plant at 
Michigan City from beginning 
operations in 1986. Bailly 
Downwind is an offshoot of the 
alliance and has a following of 
students and faculty members 
in the Notre Dame-Saint Mary's 
community. 

The Bailly I plant would be 
the ftrst nuclear powered sta­
tion in the No_nh Indiana Public 
Service Company's (NIPSCO) 
power grid. A license to 
commence work on Bailly I was 
issued in 1971. Almost immed­
iately, public interest groups 
began delaying tactics to pre­
vent progress. So far only the 
pilings have been approved. 

The generator and other­
plant components are still sit­
tin~in warehouses. 

Bailly Downwind has four 
established goals according to 
group spokesman Elizabeth 
Gilben. Its primary concerns 
are stopping the Bailly project, 
stopping funher nuclear plant 
building, promoting citizen 
input into energy policy and 
promoting safe energy alterna­
tives such as solar, geothermal 
and wind power. 

The group also opposes two 
completed Michigan plants, the 
2,000 megawatt Daniel Cook 
Plant a~ Bridgeman and the 
Palisades Plant in South Haven. 

Bailly Downwind states that 
South Bend is directly in the 
path of windborn panicles and 
gases that could be released 
during emergencies from the 
Michigan plants. 

Pubic safety is the major 
worry ofGilben, a Notre Dame 
sociology professor. "Some 
plants may have a type of valve 
that can misfunction and emit 
radioactive gases or panicles 
containing radiation mto the 
atmosphere.'' 

Gilben, a member of Down­
wind's steering committee, 
expressed concern over nuclear 
power plant proliferation in the 
vicinity of South Bend. 
''Nuclear power is too expens­
ive to make safe,'' she said. ''It 

takes 12 to 14 years to build a 
plant and they cost over 1 
billion dollars a piece. Twenty­
five percent of all new capital 
investment in this country is 
going for plants that are/ood 
for only 30 to 40 years--1' like 
to see that money go towards 
developing renewable 
supplies.'' 

Professor Peter Smith of 
SMC believes that radioactive 
emissions might build up and 
contaminate Warren Dunes 
State Park. The dunes are only 
five miles from the Cook Plant. 
Radioactive effluent can accum­
ulate in the sand and possibly 
effect persons who frequent the 

[continued on page 2.] 

THURS.-~ffiOLSON PARTY & RUffi&COKES & 7-7's 

- ... ...... •••• """*"'"• """' ·-10 2/Sl ;ti 10-11 60c ·. 
FRI. SENIOR HAPPY HOUR 11-12 70c 
~7 25c drnfts SOc bnr drinks 12-close 75c ... _ ....... iiiii ... 

PREGAmE SPECIAL OPEN 10 t\m DOUBLE BLOODY mARYS 7 
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ARmANpo's· 
SARBER & HAIR 

STYLE SHOP 
1437 N. Ironwood Dr' 

GSA auditor reveals lax safeguards 
South Bend 
277-0615 

Sue, Ruthie, Kim 
Armando --stylist 

mon-wed-frl 8-5:30 
tues-thurs 8-8 pm 

sat 8-2 
by appt. only 

sat-no appt. needed 

W ASHIJ'\~TON (AP) -
Financial saf~guards at the 
General Services Adminis­
tration are so lax that its own 

' "luditors were able to trick the 
scandal-ridden agency into 

. sending a $95,000 check to a 
1· fictitious firm for goods never 

supplied, the chief GSA auditor 
said yesterday. 

I Howard Davia, deputy in­
' spector general for audits, told 

Senate subcommittee that GSA 
1 auditors obtained the check last 
July by introducing false infor­
mation into the agency's com­
puter system in Kansas City. 

HOMECOMING~.......,.,... ..... 
~OMMITTEE~ 
........,.~~~"-'-MEETING 

ALL WHO ARE INTERESTED 

7:30 TONITE 
student union offices 
2nd floor LaFortune 

$1.00 WILL BUY 
YOU: 

your own private tailgater ~eluding: . 
2 cans of Fox Deluxe beer 
1 bag of chips 1 half of a hot dog 

1 scoop of onion dip 
and 1 Alka Seltzer tablet 

-------PLA~TS-TC>-Cic) ______ i 
----------------- I I 

10% Discount to all students with IDJ 
on all plants a & imported pottery 1 

also macrame 
jewelry coupon expires 10/3/79 

2 blocks past O'Hanlon's on Ironwood 
1st atop sign, left on ffillburne ~ 

2502 ffillburne 259-5313 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

-· I I . ------------------------------· 

~ .... •' 

Thurs. Sept. 27 THE 
OPEN STAGE (9-12) N 

Fri. Sept. 28 (11:45-1 pm) A 
Lunchtime Concert 

~ Gene Barbanera 
EVENING Chris Morgan ~ 

Dan Keusal 
Jeannie Ritter (9-?) 

_ ....... ~ .. .... . 
·' ,. 

'' 

Davia said the incident 
demonstrated weaknesses in 
the agency's payment proced­
ures. He urged tighter controls 
to assure that checks are sent 
only to bona fide contractors. 
Asked by Sen. Max Baucus,D­

Mont., chairman of the Senate 
Judiciary subcommittee on fed­
eral contracts, if such a "sting" 
could be successful again, 
Davia replied that weaknesses 
in GSA's financial safe-
guards create "many oppor­
tunities" for such payments. 
However, William J. Rita, 

GSA finance director, angrily 
denounced the test as a "piece 
of theatrics" that succeeded 
only because the auditors sup­
pressed the very controls they 
were testing. 
In an internal GSA memoran-

dum released yesterday, Rita 
noted that a receiving clerk had 
found that the _,.ordered supplies 
were not delivered, but were 
stoJ?ped by the · auditors from 
nontying the finance division . 
"In this bizarre episode, it 

seems the auditors set out to 
prove that if they used their 
credentials to suppress or over­
ride all internal contols, there 
would be no internal controls,'' 
Rita said. 
The memo, which listed its 

subject as ''the gang that 
couldn't shoot straight," said 
the "fraud" was detected sev­
en days after the check was 
issued and the money was 
recovered. 
Rita said that althou~h the 

finance division is '' inclmed to 
believe'' the false payment was 

part of a legitimate audit, the 
matter has been referred to 
GSA's office of investigations 
"on the chance that we are 
dealing here with real fraud.'' 
For more than a year, the 

GSA has been the subject of a 
major investigation into wide­
spread fraud and abuse that by 
some estimates cost the gover­
nment more than $100 million a 
year. 
The investigation has resulted 

in the indictment of 115 former 
and present GSA officials, con­
tractors and other government 
employees. Of those, 89 de­
fendants have/leaded guilty or 
been convicte on fraud 
charges. 
Another 25 have not yet been 

tried. One government official 
was found Innocent. 

Mark Luetkehans heads the ball 
away from a Kalamazoo de­
fender in yesterday 's 11-1 vic 

tory. Looking on are Oliver by Tom jackman). 
Franklin and Kevin Lovejoy 
j 25]. see story page 16. [photo 

AtND 

Food service supports Nestle ban 
by Don Schmid products in stock at the time the 

ban was initiated have been 

The University' dir~tive ban­
ning the use of Nestl roducts 
has successfully been" arried 
out according to Robert bin­
son, director of Notre D e 
food service\.: 

Robinson reported that food' 
service has stopped purchasing 
the four basic Nestle products 
they were using: Libby canned 
goods, Nestle powdered tea, 
Nestle Crunch bars, and Nestle 
hot chocolate mix. He estima­
ted that virtually all the Nestle 

Belie_fs 

!(roup sets 
• meettn!( 

There will be an organizational 
meeting at 6 p.m. Sunday in the 
Regina North Loun~e for the 
"Inquiry Into Catholtc Beliefs" 
discussion group. Basic ques­
tions about the Catholic faith 
will be discussed. Sr. Veronica, 
of Saint Mary's cam_pus minis-· 
try, will lead the dtscussion. 
The meeting is open to the 
public. 

.. 

depleted. 
"There was a small, if any, 

monetary impact on our opera­
tions when we stopped using 
Nestle Products, "Robinson sta­
ted. "However, it did eliminate 
Nestle from our competitive 
bidding program and they (Nes­
tle) were very competitive." 
The elimination of Nestle 

"Nestea" powdered ice tea mix 
did cause the dining halls to 
stop serving powdered iced tea 
because the dispensing mach­
ines could not be converted to 
accomodate other brands , " 
Robinson said. He also stated 
that a similar problem occurred 
with the hot chocolate dispen­
sers, but he expects hot choco-1 

late to be offered very soon in 

, 

(continued from page 3] 

ate School of J oumalism. She 
also served as an Information 
Officer in the U.S. Air Force for 
15 years. 

She left the Air Force with 
the rank of Captain and entered 
Georgetown University Law 
Center. She graduated in 1975· 
and was admitted to the District 
of Columbia Bar. She then 

the dining halls. 
"The boycott has been effec­

tive here in that all Nestle 
products are no longer being 
purchased," World Coalition 
Director Mike Stegman, "On a 
nationwide scale, I'm not sure 
now effective the boycott has 
been in changing Nestle 
policy." · 
He added that the WHC will 

__ conduct a study this year of 
Nestle marketing policy in the 
Third World and will make a 
report to the students. 
Huddle manager John Pros­

niewski stated that the directive 
has also been implemented 
smoothly at the Huddle. The 
Huddle has replaced some Nes­
tle products with Lipton and 
Royal food products without its 
increasing costs. 

, , Speakers 
joined a law ftrm where she 
worked until she accepted the 
position of Director of Planned 
Giving at SMC. 

The Planned Giving organ­
ization is part of the Develop­
ment Office at Saint Mary's and 
engages in alumnae fund rais­
ing activities-. 

The idea of a development 
organization is a .re~tiv~ly new 
one and many msntunons as 
well as charities are adopting it. 
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SMC-ND plans ()ktoberfest celebration JUST FOR THE RECORD I ~ 'In the 100 Center offefl 
by Mary Angela Shannon 

Although Oktoberfest in Ger­
many is coming o its end, 
Oktoberfest in the SMC-ND 
community will soon begin. 
And like the German Oktober­
fest celebration, Oktoberfest 
here will be conducted in giant 
~ircus-type beer tents. 
Lisa Fulks, chairman, and 

Mike Murphy, co-chairman of 
this year's Oktoberfest, are two 
1977-1978 Innsbruck Program 
participants. Because of Inns­
bruck' s locality, they were able 
to attend the German Oktober­
fest held in Munich. Both 
have relied on the memory of 
their experience at Oktoberfest 
in Munich to make Oktoberfest 
here as authentic as possible. 
This year's Oktoberfest has 

been shortened to a period of 
three days. On Wednesday, 
October 3, there will be a 
German dinner at St. Marv's 
for St. Mary's students only~ 

On Thursday, October 4, the 
main Oktoberfest celebratiom 
will take place from 6-11 p.m. 
on the quad next to St. Mary's 

cafeteria. This event will be the 
Bier Garten. 
This year is the first time ever 

for the Bier Garten to be held 
outside. Three 30 by 60 ft. 
circus-type tents will house the 
event. 

One tent will have long tables 
and benches for beer drinking, 
just as in Munich's Oktober­
fest. 

A second tent will have tables 
and a dance floor. A German 
band will provide the music. 
A third tent will sell food. 

Taffy apples, bratwurst (grill­
ed in beer and onions), and soft 
drinks , which have been ordered 
through food distributors, will 
be sold in the food tents. 
Girls, reminiscent of the wait­

resses in the German beer 
tents, will be selling hot, giant, 
soft pretzels. 

''The band will be placed 
betwe<~n the beer tent and the 
dancing tent so that everybody 
can hear the music,'' said 
Murphy. 
There will be folk dancers, 

chugging contests, a bell­
ringing, muscle-testing mach­
ine, and possibly an old car that 

House finalizes canal treaty, 
submits proposals to Carter 
WASHINGTON (AP) - The 

House passed and sent to 
P~esident Carter yesterday a 
btll to carry out final details of 
the treaties that will eventually 
give control of the Panama 
Canal to Panama. 

House members had turned 
down a similar measure last 
week. But they approved the 
bill 232 to 188 after backers of 
the treaties argued that defeat 
might bring chaos in Panama. 
The Senate approved the legis­
lation Tuesday. 
The treaties, which take effect 

Monday, will end U.S. poss­
ession of the Panama Canal, 
which slices across the Central 
American country and connects 
the Pacific Ocean with the 
Caribbean. 

Carter and Panamanian lead­
ers already had signed the 
treaties and they had been 
ratified by the Senate. 
The bill, now headed for 

certain signing by Carter, est­
ablishes a new U.S. -controlled 
commission that will operate 
the canal until, under the 
treaties, the Panamanian gov­
ernment takes full control of the 
waterway on Dec. 31, 1999. 

House defeat of the canal leg­
islation last week was an em­
barrassment to Carter, who is 
sending Vice President Walter 
Mondale and Secretary of 
State Cyrus Vance to Panama 
on Monday for ceremonies 
marking the end ofU.S. posses­
sion of the canal. 
Prior to yesterday's vote, 

Carter personally telephoned 
treaty opponents aqd House 
leaders, appealing for approval 
of the bill. 

In debate before yesterday's 
final vote, House Speaker 
Thomas P. O'Neill told his col­
leagues the canal is regarded 
by Latin Americans as ''the 
apple of American imperial­
ism'' and urged them to ap­
prove the bill as the final stop m 
carrying out the treaties .. 

' 'We'll keep our work,'' 
O'Neill said.'' I think it's going 
to be a friendlier Western 
hemisphere.'' 
The bill's floor manager, Rep. 

John M. Murphy, D-N.Y., told 
the House that rejection of the 
bill could spark violence in 

Fa nama. 
''A time bomb is ticking away 

... Murphy said. "We have 
one week before we might face 
chaos in Panama." 

Rep. Robert Bauman, R-Mo., 
who had been a leading oppo­
nent of the bill, told the House 
the measure had to be passed to 
protect the U.S. rights to run 
the canal and station troops 
there until the waterway be­
comes Panamanian property at 
the end. of the century. 
But Rep. Floyd Spence, R-S.C. 

appealed to the House to 
stand fast against the bill. 
"We're trying to appease our 

enemies," Spence contended. 
"We have given in and we have 
been pushed around by every­
body and we invite more of the 
same.'' 
Rep. George Hanses, R-Ida­

ho, also urged defeat of the 
measure, saying: "With Soviet 
combat troops in the Carib­
bean, do we dare give away the 
Panama Canal? Those Russian 
troops are training Marxist 
terrorists all over the Carib­
bean." 
The treaties turn most of the 

Panama Canal Zone over to 
Panama at the stroke of mid­
night Monday. Other canal 
property will be turned over to 
Panama in stages, concluding 
with the transfer of the canal 
itself at the end of the century. 

Stttdents, 

_facul~y must 

ml)Ve cars 
All students and faculty 

members who have cars parked 
in the A-1, B-2, C-3, and D-2 
lots asked by the Notre 
Dame Security Department to 
move their cars out of those 
areas before 8 a.m. Saturday. 
Cars may be parked in Green 
Field :for the duration of the 
game. 

can be crashed up with a sledge 
hammer. 
According to Fulks, this year 

will be the first time that the 
entire Miller Beer Force will be 
at Oktoberfest. Between · 35 
and 50 kegs of Lowenbrau dark, 
Miller Lite, and regular Miller 
beer are anticipated. Miller 
will be giving out prizes and 
decoratin~ the tents. 
Proper tdentification will be 

required for the beer tent, but 
no identification is required for 
the other two tents. ''Twenty­
one ID's will be required and 
strictly enforced for admittance 
to the beer tent. If all cooperate 
we will be able to continue the 
outside beer tents next year, 
too," said Fulks. 
In case of rain or wind, the 

Bier Garten will still be held 
outside in the tents, since all 
three tents are rain proof and 
can be tied down against the 
wind. _ 

''The Oktoberfest fever is 
really catching on,' 'Fulks com­
mented. "So many are talking 
it uo rhat we have over a 
hundred people, including fac­
ulty, who have been or will be 
working during Oktoberfest.'' 
Fulks hopes that the outside 

Oktoberfest tents . will enable 
everyone to sit down, socialize, 
and drink without being over­
whelmed by music and other 
people. ''The inside beer tents 
of previous years have not 
enabled this," she said. 
Oktoberfest will end Friday 

and Saturday night with the 
movie "Sound of Music" to be 
shown in Carroll Hall at St. 
Mary's. 

I
I • '10% off on I 

EVERYTHING I 
·I il with ID & coupon 
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A 
FISh Story 

~~Y'fwTtow! 
AU-you-can-eat fish 

all the time 

All-you-can-eat ~ bar 

All-you-can-eat frog's legs 
on Mondays 

Open For lunch 
- Noon Specials -
Platters, Sandwiches 

* Homl'made Soups, Chowder, Clams, Shrimp, Lobster 

And your favorite beer and wine 

52129 
U.S. 31 No. 
South Bend .. FISH OF STROH 

FAMILY RESTAURANT 

277-0103 
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ALL CLUBS & ORGANIZATIONS MUST REPORT FOR A f 
10 MINUTE INTERVIEW FOR THURSDAY EVENING, SEPTf 
27, 1979 OR SUNDAY AFTERNOON, SEPT. 30, 1979 TO BE : 

HELD IN ROOM 124 IN THE HAYES-HEALY BLDG. f 

-----------~IIlfRsl>X~s£I>i~27~------------
CLUB OR ORGANIZATION 

TIME 
6:00 
6:10 
6:20 
6:30 

6:40 
6:50 
7:00 
7:10 

7:20 

7:30 
7:40 
7:50 
8:00 
8:10 
8:20 
8:30 
8:40 
8:50 
9:00 
9:10 
9:20 
9:30 
9:40 
9:50 
10:00 
10:10 
10:20 
10:30 

10:40 
10:50 

Roman Macia 
Chris Kane 
Janine Wagner 
Therese Davis 
Dugo Pena 
Mike O'Connor 
Rick Pinkowski 
Jim Magers 
Mike Sis 
John Gruesser 
Rick Reidy 

383 Dillon Hall 
219 Fisher Hall 
204 Lyons Hall 
327 Badin Hall 
316 St. Eds Hall 
424 Carroll Hall 
161 Cavanaugh. Hall 

Old College, Box 638 
Zahm Hall 

3746 
1961 
7883 

8840 
6839 
1475 

~~38 
8350 

Omicron Delta Kappa 
Arnold Air Society 
Beta Alpha Psi 
Nieghborhood Roots 
Neighborhood Roots 
Rook & Euchre Club 
Pep Rally Committee 
Pep Rally Committee 
N.D .. Texas Club 
International Students 

Ken Lynch 501 River Ave. 234·1860 'BI k B · St d Kim Hereford ac usmess u ents 
Francisco Hernandez Black Business Students 
Mark Ferror Univer. Village 277-2329 M.E.C.H.A. 

818 Flanner Hall 1167 Math Club 
Steve Reifenberg 301 Sorin Hall 8538 Gymnastics Club 
Curt Hench 338 Stanford Hall 8716 J d Cl 
Curt Hench 

u o ub 
338 Stanford· Hall 8716 Mudsha ' R bl' Bob Curley rK epu IC 202 Pangborn Hall 8366 LaCrosse Club 

Dom Narducci Arch. Box T 1563 AlA Siudent Chapte,-
Zena Crenshaw 320 Badin Hall 6975 Black Cultural Arts 
Chris Digan 415 St. Ed's Hall 8867 UNITED WAY 
Victor Ortale 54585 Irish Way (203) 277·0671 ROME Yearbook 
Paul Julin 221 St. Ed's Hall 8831 P I Mary Anne Hughes olitica Action Club 
Edward J. Bylina 329 Breen Phillips 1327 NC·SMC Right to Life 

Mary Meg McCarthy ;~~ ~~l~h ~~J 1 ~~~ ~f~ege Bowl" 
Stephen Ledoux 222 Keenan Hall 3276 Big Brothers/Big Sisters 
Jerry Daus 317 Morrissey Hall 3578 Sailing Club 
Mike Roe 904 Grace Hall 1765 S C l'f Cl Deb Smith o. a 1 ornia ub 
Kathy Shanahan 323 Breen Phillips 1321 Women's Advisory Club 
Andy Koors 209 Lyons Hall 7888 Zeta Phi 

Zeta Phi 
John Cooney 709 Grace Hall 1737 P. Sigma Alpha 
Tom Crotty 806 St. Louis Blvd. 233-5525 S · Cl Nick Schneeman emor ass 

11 :OO 806 St. Louis Blvd. 233-5525 Senior Class 
Brad Vossberg 336 Alumni Hall 1198 Sociology Club 

11 :10 John M. Co~gisiono 124 Zahm Hall 8879 Water Polo Club 
~ 1 :20 Bruce A. Leibert 261 Cavanaugh Hall 1475 Sorin Club 

1 ~:~ Bill Strotman. 117 Z?hm Hall 8872 Men's Volleyball 

1 
. Ken Ostro~sk1 002 F1sher Hall 1874 Beta Gamma Sigma 

l-...:~---~.::,~v_:~ _____ _!4~L!:'::_~~ 3812 N.D. Historical Societv 

1 
~n~ J?e Slovinec 389 Dillol\ ~~--~;;---~;:g~::;---------~ 

I SUN 12:20 T!m Dages 519 Grace Hall 1865 Management Club I 
: T1m Dag~s 519 Grace Hall 1865 Sophomore Class I 

I 12JO Debbie Bieber 137 Farley Hall 6732 . N.D. Tech Review 1 
I SEPT 12:40 Bnan McMerty 605 St. Peter St. 232-7388 AISEC I 
I • 12.50 Varna Man~ault 401 Farley Hall 6872 RAPPORT 

I 1:00 D~v1d H~rd.1ve 007 Sorin Hall 8782 Finance Club I 
I 30th 

1:10 M1ke Oumllvan 605 St. Peter St. 232·7388 Ski Team I 
1:20 Tom Maurath 232·3301 Paddlefish I 

I ~ ;~ John Doheny 323 Morrissey Hall 3584 St. Louis Club 1 
1 

1
. D~ve Dreyer~----~---.-----·---------2209--· --~--tegatAid'~!!nC!e( ______ .... I 

L--------·~--~e Cato 224 Dillon 1692 Fellow. of Chri~ti~ t.lthl..ta. 
-----~-----------~--~~~~~~~~--~-~ 
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Editorials 
o we get our llloney's worth? 

' t It seems to me that, at the 
tery time when we are best able 
, reflect upon and assess the 
P:Jeaning of our lives and the 
.redicaments of the world 

E
ound us, very few, ·if any, are 
king full advantage of the 

pr.ortunity. 

f
, 'The purpose of a colleS.e 
ducation,'' Sydney ] . Hams 
rites "is to make one's mind 

. good place to spend. one's 
leisure.'' Given this truthful 
guideline, you W<?uld think. t~at 
we collegiates would be smvmg 
lO root out ingrained prejudices 
ilnd presuppositions from our 
beliefs, seeking out truths· and 
principles which we can live 
rand dte for. But the fact is that 
we are not so conscientious ·· 
and we should be. 

By this I do not me!ln t~at we 
~hould spend more ume m the 

~
wers; much more can .;be 
acned by an i~forme~ conv~r· 

ation and a ltttle white wme 
an by staring endlessly at a 
tebook. Rather, I would like 
suggest that we · be more 

iligent in questioni!lg o~r 
stc canons, and moremtent m 

eriving our conClusions, if, in 
ct, conclusioqs can ever be 

'ghtfully drawn ... 
L For example, America's fore· 
~ost socialist, Michael 

-......;.;:..., __ _.y_~;.-....-- < ·~ 

Harrington, addressed a 
captivated crowd last Thursday 
in the library auditorium. He 
offered food for thought for 
conservatives, liberals and 
radicals alike, questioning the 
relationship between equality, 
justice and the American 
economic system, and his 
views should not be shrugged 
off carelessly. Though it may 
well be that "bein~ America's 
foremost socialist ts a lot like 
being the tallest building in 
Kansas City. " I would be 
willing to wager that every 
person on this campus had 
some insight to gain by having 
their conservative ideology 
questioned or the consequences 
of their radical idealism spelt 
out. 

Granted, many of us were 
recovering from our first 
physics or biology test, and 
others were frantically finishing 
assignments for Friday's 
classes, but that belittles the 
point that I am trying to make. 
A university setting provides an 
ideal environment for 
discovering that which is true 
and timeless, but only our own 

·initiative can actualize that 
possibility. 

We should never be looking 
for reasons to believe what we 

Terry Keeley 
already know, but looking for 
insights that would teach us 
.something which we might 
otherwise overlook. We have to 
be open to having our minds 
challenged, and willing to not 
take the path of least resistance 
since we know that we will 
emerge more knowledgeable as 
the result. 

We have to be wise enough ro 
seek the long run benefits of an 
education, knowledse that will 
help us to live our hves, rather 
than the short run ''make the 
Dean's list" benefits. 

We have to be daring enough 
to ask Professor Loux to 
elucidate the meaning of the 
"morally good" act, and we 
have to seriously question 
Professor Roos about the ability 
of.' our nation to face the 
problem of environmental 
degradation democratically. 
We have to be rational and 
persevering in our scholarly 
pursuits, leaving no stone 
unturned as the result of poor 
judgement or lack of effon. 

We each paid over . three 
thousand dollars for tuition, 
books and a place to sleep this 
semester •· if nothing else, we 
at least have to get our money's ; 
wonh. 

P. 0. Box Q 
Cyclist receives 

poor treatment 

at Notre Daine 

5,000 miles on my motorr::ycle 
.,,.,~~ and people all over the U.S. and 
~·''?', .. in Canada went out of their way 

,,_;!''to be friendly and helpful to me. 

Dear Editor: 

Recently I went on a ~tWo 
week vacation from :Des 
Moines, Iowa going out ·to 
Maine and then down to 
Virsinia and then back to Des 
Momes. Being a Catholic and 
of Irish ancestry, I wanted to 
stop and see Notre Dame 
campus for a few minutes. 
Dunng the two week trip I put 

The only place I was 
rendered even the slightest 
discourtesy was on your 
campus. When I came up to the 
guardhouse, I asked if I needed 
a pass to get on the campus 
grounds. I was told I couldn't 
go on the grounds; no 

. motorcycles were allowed. 
Upon asking how big the 
campus was, I was told it didn't 
matter, no motorcycles were 
allowed. I then asked if I would 
be allowed to walk on the 
campus and how long it would 
take to see the campus. I was 
told it was "quite btg." 

No one offered a suggestion 

\of places to visit or where to 
park; the only suggestion 
advanced was ''No motorcycles 
are allowed.'' I stopped at two 
different guardhouses and met 
the same indifference (and 
maybe even fear) at both. I 
decided not to park the bike 
since I had over $150 of 
camping equipment strapped to 
the back of the bike. No one 
had offered to watch my bike if I 
wished to visit your campus. 

I dido' t get very upset over 
my treatment until after I left 
and the rest of the so called 
' 'sinful world'' that I hear about 
every Sunday treated me with 
even more than common 
courtesy. A state park 
employee in Indiana gave me 
the best tent site in the park, a 

of either institution. 
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SM C Student Assembly 
needs clarification 

As active members of Saint 
Mary's Student. Government, 
we appreciate The Observer's 
acknowled~ement Sept. 24 of 
our revitalization program for a 
currently misused and 
misunderstood instrument of 
student involvement, student 
assembly. For any elected 
officer, on any campus, apathy 
is always the major obstacle to 
overcome. 

Actually, if apathy was ever 
totally overcome and replaced 
by involvement, social concern 
and consciousness, our 
positions would present no 
challenge. However, we 
believe Saint Mary's to have 
the most caring and concerned 
student body to be found. The 
Ohserver cites as a sad 
commentary on the Saint 
Marys' student body, the lack 
of candidates who ran for 
student assembly, not even 
enough to warrant opposition. 
Before terming this apathy, let 
us explore other avenues for 
explanation. 

Of course, student govern­
ment is not the sole vehicle for a 
student to express her suppon 
and concern for others. The 

New York park employee 
checked up three times to see if 
I needed anything, a parking lot 
attendant in Niagara, Canada 
refused to let me pay to park. 
This treatment lasted my whole 
trip with one exception: Notre 
Dame. 

The treatment I received 
from most of the people I met 
could only be described ~s 
Christlike; they gave of thetr 
time or they sought to ease my 
way when they knew I could not 
pay them bac~--or they just 
expressed an mterest m my 
trip. Chr~·tless was the trea~­
ment I got at Notre Dame; 1t 
was legal, cold, friendless, and 
quite strict, but not Christian. 

David W. McBride 

,+IY (j{)f}j 
THINK OF 
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extremely high and intense 
involvement by many students 
in the form of volunteer 
services greatly depletes our 
resources. However, this is not 
a disadvantage but a 
complement to student govern­
ment. 

The answer co what The 
Observer terms apathy is really 
lack of commumcation. The 
relatively low number of 
students wishing to become 
senators to the assembly stems 
not from lack of interest and 
unwillingness to assume 
responsibility, but from a vague 
and undefined role of student 
assembly. How can students b_e 
expected to assume responst­
bility that cannot be defined or 
expressed? In the past, a clear 
and well-defined role of student 
assembly has not been 
articulated to the student body. 
If there is to be a finger 
pointed, it should be aimed at 
the student leaders for not 
communicating and knowing 
themselves what form the 
student assembly should take. 
If the student leaders are 
confident about the role of the 
assembly, then the students 
will understand their position 
and be able to assume 
responsibility. 

This hypothesis, so to speak, 
can be exemplified through the 
history of the Saint Mary's 
freshman council. As it existed 
last year, the council was a 
vague entity, practically 
anarchial, which no one in 
student government or the 
campus at large understood. 
Consequently, fifteen students 
ran for fourteen positions. So 
much for the traditional frosh 
enthusiasm. 

This year, however, the 
council has been redefined 
complete with a purpose, 
direction and set of goals 
articulated to the freshman. 
The response to this education 
has been an overwhelming 
forty-five platforms submitted 
for ten positions. This deluge 
of involvement of the present 
class as compared to the 
previous class has little or 
nothing to do with a generation 
gap, but results from how their 
role as potential leaders was 
presented to them. The 
hypothesis seems to work. 

We, as student leaders, are 
quite aware of past lack of 
student involvement in terms of 
our own inefficencies in 
vocalizing well-structured and 
goal oriented options for them 
to assume responsibility. We 
are also, as a cohesive Broup, 
making the necessary strtdes to 
correct our failures. We know 
rhat the students are willing; it 
is our job to _present them with 
concrete chmces. 

f'U: '!'rigiani and 
Saint Milrv 's Student 

Covemment 
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Polishecl lRuff Cutt - Ragged Palmer 
Surprisingly enough, it was a rock 

'n' roll crowd that paid their way in 
to Morris Civic Auditoripm to see 
Robert Palmer perform Sunday 
night. Oh sure, the teeny hoppers 
and young couples were there too, 
the crowd you'd normally expect for a 
Top 40 vocalist, but the rockers were 
the ones who filled the seats and the 
auditorium with dope smoke. 

Palmer's warm-up band, South 
Bend's Ruff Cutt, didn't disappoint 
that crowd in the least. Although 
they've only been together for three 
months, they had the arena singing 
along and clapping throughout their 
too short set, while taking advantage 
of Morris Civic's immaculately clean 
sound system. 

When Palmer hit the stage shortly 
after in his Steve Martin Special 
white suit, the audience was ready. 
He opened with "Every Kind of 
People,'' his single from the Double 
Fun LP, and set the tone for the 
show - slow, sleepy and lethargic. He 
followed with "Woman You're 
Wonderful,'' from his newest album. 
From there is was downhill. 

With a young crowd that was 
begging to be rocked, Palmer 
responded with a string of new 
material that got pregessively slower 
and soon drove the excitement of the 
audience right out the door. 
Palmer's musicians (his own musical 
contribution amounted to strumming 
the same chord for each song through 
about half the set) displayed 
absolutely no musical talent, in 
keeping with their already vilified 
efforts on "Secrets, " they were 
completely stationary and let Palmer 
do all the entertaining. 

With the focus on Palmer, one 
comes to the realization that he has 
no outstanding performing abilities. 

Robe1·t Palmer at the Morris Civ;c · _______ _2Pc..!h~o!!:t~o~by Mick. Mancuso 
He has minimal stage presence, Feat roots near the end of the set for 
prances .around in a small area the old hits "Woman Is Smarter," 
clapping his hands like an arthritic "Put on Your Pancin Shoes," and a 
grandfather at Studio 54, and does no solidly funky version of "Sneakin 
talking between songs. Most tunes Sally Through the Alley" in which his 
merely segued into each other band seemed to come out of its trance 
unoriginally. Additionally, one momentarily. 
notices that Palmer's vocals have no Palmer finished, predictably, with 
really atuactive qualities. They are "Bad Case of Loving You," and 
merely good, but not exceptional, returned for a perfunctory encore of, 
sort of like Bob and Jane singing predictably, the only two rockers he 
"Moon River" every week on the really knows, "Jealous" and "You're 
Lawrence Welk show. Gonna Get What's Coming." But by 

By the middle of Palmer's set, the this time people were leaving in 
crowd was tranquilized as he ran droves, disappointed by a perform-
through more unaltered versions of ance which did not improve or 
songs from his last two albums, improvise at all upon his decidely 
except for a slowed down ending to mediocre recent studio releases. · 
one of his best tunes, "The Best of RuffCutt, however, was a refresh-
Both Worlds,'' which was totally ing chan~e of pace and was clearly 
ruinous. He returned to his Little the highlight of the evening. They 

F======================= 
Saint Mar_v'S Harpsichord U'eekend 

Tom jackman 
are a five man band which exhibits 
the influences of '70s rock with some 
new twists. The lead singer is a 
composmon of everybody in his 
on-stage persona, singing masterful­
ly but also contributing some great 
wailing trumpet solos a la Maynard 
Ferguson during the band's opening 
number. He didn't pick it up again 
after that, but he should have. 

Keyboardist Harold Frazee adds 
another new dimension to the band, 
b_esides his Tom Scholz-like synthe-
sizer playing and superb organ and 
piano lines. Ee can sing too (which is 
a feature most bandscan't claim) and 
his soaring harmonic vocal duet with 
Watson on the third song was simply 
magnificent. David Holloway's fine 
lead guitar play included several 
superior solos and one outstanding 
blues run. 

Ruff Cutt' s repertoire is typical of a 
band ,trying to hit the big time while 
playing the bar circuit, everything fro 
the Rolling Stones and Bob Seger to 
!"oreigner and the Blues Brothers. 
They played only originals in their 
flfst major show under this name, but 
still displayed their versatility per­
forming love songs as well as their 
all-out rockers. Watson, drummer 
Tony Huszar and bassist Paul Stokes 
were the core for several area bands 
before forming Ruff Cutt. Stokes, 
who had been concentrating on his 
bass during the show, was surprised 
to.learn of the crowd's enthusiastic 
reception, and asked, "Even with the 
power cut back?" 

This band will be performing 
around town for about three more 
weeks before moving its base to 
Miami--you may not hear from them 
a~ai~ until they're on the radio with a 
htt stngle. · 

iSastmllu iJnrnque 
Sarah Ann Lanman 

Last weekend Saint Mary's College 
was host to a group of vtsitors who 
were busy with activities that did not 
include watching the· Notre Dame­
Purdue game or studying for 
Monday's big exam. Performers, 
craftsmen, students, and other inter­
ested individuals from around the 
country spent most of their three-day 
visit attending recitals and work­
shops and exploring that common 
interest which brought them together 
at Saint Mary's: harpsichords and 
harpsichord music. 

Through the many harpsichord 
exhibits, performances, and discus­
sions about the music, this group of 
harpsichord enthusiasts and others 
around the world are, in effect, 
keeping alive the music that flourish­
ed throughout Western Europe from 
1600 to 1750. This period in music 
history is generally referred to as the 
Baroque Era. 

Toward the end of the Renaissance 
and on into the beginning of the 
Baroque Era, composers began to 
take a greater interest in mstru­
mental music (as opposed to vocal 
music). After 1650 keyboard instru­
ments, specifically the harpsichord, 
had been singled out for musical 
exploration and composition. 

The harpsichord is an ancestor of 
.:he modern day piano, although the 
two instruments sound quite differ­
ent from each other. This is because 
the strings of the harpsichord are 
plucked, while those of a piano are 
struck by a hammer. The resulting 

.. . ·. 

sound of a harpsichord is character­
istically ornate and refined. By using 
additional sets of strings, variations 
in the degrees of loud and softness 
are possible. 

Hefore the harpsichord had achiev­
ed irs position as a major instrument 
for composition in continental 
Europe, related keyboard instru­
mems received the attentions of 
sixteenth-century English compos­
ers. William Byrd (1543-1623) wrote 
music for the virginal, a type of 
harpsichord with only one set of 
strings. Byrd's Pavan and Galliard 
Sir Willit.1m Petre began Saturday's 
redtal by h~sichordist Edward 
Parmentier. Glfolamo Frescobaldi, 
an early seventeenth-century Italian 
corn~;>oser, was responsible for be­
ginrung the harpsichord tradition. 

Frescobaldi's works were featured 
in the s1rudent recital on Saturday 
afternoo111 by students from Saint 
Maay's, the University of Michigan, 
and Case:· Western Reserve Univers­
ity, Johann Sebastian Bach (1685-
1750) wrote compositions for both the 
harpsichord and clavichord, another 
keyboard instrument which produces 
sound by striking brass blades 
aga:lnst strings. Bach's music was 
part of almost every recital this 
weekend since his works were a 
culmination of the Baroque style. 

Although most people think of 
Bach as the father of the Baroque 
Era, he was actually a very old­
\fashioned composer writing during 
the Lat~: Baroque period. His 

conservative works masterfully caf.>­
tured the essence of German Baroque 
music. Laurette Goldberg, Friday 
evening's featured artist, presented a 
program which contrasted the styles 
of] .S. Bach and his French contem­
porary, Francois Couperin. This 
latter composer was noted for his 
dance-like compositions. 

Harsichord music got its start from 
dance forms, and Couperin develop­
ed this type of music to perfection. 
Couperin's music demonstrated the 
delicacy and refinement which was so 
typical of French composers from the 
late seventeenth a~d early eighteenth 
centuries. This delicacy, coupled 
with the many decorative elements 
within the music, reflected the tastes 
and preferences of the French aristo­
cracy of this period. 

Both German and French composi­
tions of the Late Baroque were 
characterized by spirited, vital 
rhythms; works by German compos­
ers were emotionally more intense. 
Ms. Goldber_g's performance of 
Bach's English Suite Number One in 
A Major revealed this intensity, as 
well as the endlessly flowing and 
intertwining melodies, which was yet 
another Baroque characteristic. 

The weekend music festival was 
not strictly limited to harpsichord or 
keyboard music, however. The Ars 
Musica Baroque Orchestra (which is 
the only orchestra of its kind in the 
United States) gave a performance 
Sunday night featuring the rare 

' 

eighteenth-century instruments such 
as the three-key oboe, four-key 
bassoon, recorc\er, and baroque 
violin. The orchestral sound was 
unique because of these authentic 
instruments. Harpsichords built with 
this same idea of creating a · real 
Baroque sound were on display all 
weekend. 

Although the harpsichord was 
most popular during the late seven­
teenth and early eighteenth centur­
ies, some twentieth-century compo­
sers have written music for the 
instrument. Carol Knell, a faculty 
member of Saint Mary's Music 
Department, presented a voice recital 
offering a mce change of pace. 
Works by living American composers 
including Roslyn Brogue and David 
Diamond revealed the twentieth cen­
tury's rediscovery of the harpsichord. 

Music from the fourteenth century 
was yet another added attraction this 
weekend: A Latin mass using 
Medieval music and Gregorian 
Chants was held Sunday morning in 
the Church of Loretto. Giving 
listeners exposure to a pre-Baroque 
era of musical composition, Raymond 
Sprague directed the Saint Mary's 
Chamber Singers. 

The Harpsichord Weekend was the 
second event of its kind at Saint 
Mary's; the flfst festival was held in 
1977. The music of the Baroq_ue Era 
is still very much alive m the 
twentieth century, as demonstrated 
by the number of harpsichord enthus­
iasts whQ participated in the Festival. 

~·-

I 
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'We '11 miss him' 
MASS 

follow-ed by 
supper 

Wall retires,receives honorary luncheon 

every 
FRIDAY 
at the 

ND 9wiMI l.mion 
aM 

Stn.shitu Promotiofls 
Prt.sefll 

aod Special Guest 

BLACKFOOT 
FRIDAY OCTOBER 19th 8 pm 

Notre Dame ACC 
Tickets $8.50 and S7.50 

On sale now at ACC Box Office 
and Student Union Ticket Office 

by Ann Hesburgh 

Yesterday' s-lunch was. special 
one for former Director of 
Security Joe Wall. "We 
hate to see him go," said his 
former secretary Evelyn 
DeBowe. 

Dean Roemer gave special 
thanks to Wall at the luncheon 
for "all that he has done" for 
the University in the past year. 
Wall was then given a Univer­
sity plaque by Roemer. 
In his speech, Wall remarked 

that "I've enjoyed working here 
at the University, and I've 
made many friends among the 
faculty and students. It has 
been an experience that Ius 
made me a true Notre Dame 

Committee 

requests 

volunteers 
There will be a meeting to­

night for any] uniors interested 
in working on the committee for 
Junior Parent's weekend. The 
meeting will be held at 8 p.m. 
in the LaFortune Ballroom. If 
you have any guestions, call 
JPW chairman J tm Riedman at 
1023. 

Picnics 
• requtre 
• permzts 

Students are reminded that 
formal requests for use of 
campus grounds for picnics are 
required. Permits may be 
obtained from ] im McDonnell 
in the Student Activities Office 

~ (1st floor- LaFortune). Sponsor 
§ groups from Holy Cross Hall or 
~ Carroll Hall also need approval 
8 from the rectors. Umversity 
; policy prohibits the use of 
< alcoh«?lic_ beverages at on-cam-

pus p1cmcs. 

Ate You Tited Of The Some Old N.D. Ave. Ttek? 

FOR SOmETHING NEW AND EXCITING , HEAD EA~T 

TO THE NEWLY REmODELED FAT WALLY'S 
and thelt 

'Sute Happy its Thutsdoy Nite Potty~ 

Drink, Dance and Rock & Roll with WSND's own DJ's, as they 
CRANK IT OUT this Thursday nite from 9:30 till 1:00. So kick off 
the I HATE STATE weekend tight, at FAT WALLY'S with S2 pitchers 

and SPECIAL t-shitts, beet bucket and sign give-aways 

ALL NITE LONG. 

FAT WALL YS is located 1/2 mile EAST of campus, on U.S. 23, across 
from Krogers. T~SHIRTS GIVEN AWAY FREE TO THE FIRST 15 PEOPLE 

I, AFTER 9:QO 

fVSND PROmiSES ND-S~nc A GREAT NEW TlffiEII! 

L~~~~~ 

admirer." 
Following Wall's comments,· 

Roemer introduc•· t the new 
director of security Mr. Glen 
Terry. "My approach as new 
director of Notre Dame's Secur­
ity is one of service to the 
students, faculty, and staff, 
"Terry told the gathering. "If 
I can live up to the work of Joe 
Wall, I think the University will 
be well served, and I will be 
extremely happy.'' 
Others who attended the 

luncheon also expressed their 

feelings about Wall. ''Mr. W/all 
has brought with him new 
policies, and he has worked 
hard to create a new image for 
the department." said Dan 
Everett, a security patrolman. 
"We've come a long way." 

''As the old saying goes,'' 
commented Shift Commander 
Sgt. Boyd Fuhr, "I hate to see 
Mr. Wall leave, but I am 
looking forward to establishing 
the same kind of working 
relationship with Mr. Terry that 
we had with Mr. Wall." 

Vocalist Robert Palmer per- for a review, see page 9. [photo 
formed Sunday in South Bend by Mick. Mancuso] . 
along with local band Ruff Cult. 

ABC spends $225 million 
to televise summer o~ympics 
LOS ANGLELS (AP) - ABC, board but that approval is 

which made its past Olympic expected Oct. 25 when the 
; coverage a key part ot the board meets in Nagoya, Japan. 
network's rise to rating domi- According to the agreement, 
nance, has paid a record $225 ABC will spend $100 million for 
million to televise the 1984 U. S. televtsion right& and $125 
Summer Olympics from Los million to the LAOC for 
Angeles, Olympic officials an- production and support ser­
nounced yesterday. vices, which, Arledge said, 
ABC plans more than 200 could include help in areas such 

hours of live programming from as transportation and providing 
the 1984 Games, ABC news and results of the contests. 
sports chief Roone Arledge told ABC must also nrovide a 
a news conference. F 

The 1980 Summer Olympics "clean broadcast stgnal" for 
from Moscow will be telecast by foreign users and a broadcast 
NBC, which paid about $100 center where the signal would 
million for the rights. be picked up. 

ABC telecast the Summer . Arled8~ satd the network costs 
Games in 1973 and 1976 and a 10 addition to the four stated in 

1 commitments "could exceed 
widely held belief in the tee- anoth r *100 'll" b h 
vision indust( is that ABC's f th e ".11 b mt ton, ubtl muc . . o at w1 e recovera e. 
promouon o tts programs, Wh · d 
particularly in 1976, helped .the 1~~4 ~~~~t~~n~f:c~o:~~rfur 
ABC ~e~ome no.l. the 1980 Games, Arled e 
In a J01J?t announce~ent, the chuckled and said ''Th 19~4 

Internatwnal Olymptc Com- . b . ' e 
· 'd "We believe this to game~ will e twtce ~s ~Z?od as 

mlttee sat • . 
1 

. · those m 1980. Bem~ m the 
be the largest smgle te evtston U" d b . 1- h -· d " -0. an emg IVe, t e mterest 
agreement ever negouate . ·11 b h I d • k h 
The formal announcement, WI e uge. on t n_ow . ow 
h' h had been outlined to the the others _figured their btds, 

w tc . d b · d but we dectded what we could 
AssoCiate Press y m ustry affi d fi d · · f1 · d 
sources Monday, was made at a odr • tgufr.; !? m auon an 

c b M · rna e our o 1er. 
new~ comerence_ Y . omque CBS re ortedly bid $160 mii­
Berhouxm executive dtrector of r c ·p .84 G d NBC 
h I . 1 OJ mpic wn wr the ames an 

t e !lternauona Y reportedly bid $150 million, but 
Commtttee, and . Pete~ V. the IOC and bAOC represent-
Ueberroth managtng duector · ·d h h d d ' · auves sat t ev a agree 
of the_ Los Angeles Olymptc with the networks not to discuss 
Committee. h b'd 1 h h h 'd h 
Th 'd h t t must be t e 1 s, at oug t ey sat t e ey sa1 t e con rae , b"d h d b · · 

approved by the IOC executive. 1 s a _ een compeun_ve. 
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Mardi Gras Jre·venue aids groups STUDENTS are reminded 
that Dean Roemer has requested 

by Mary Fran Callahan 

The Mardi Gras Committee 
has selected thirteen volunteer 
~roups and charitable organiza­

nons to receive $10,000 in funds 
from last year's festival. At the 
meeting Tuesday, the commit­
tee added three groups that had 
never before received funds to 
the collection list. 

These new groups include 
Joliet Center for Criminal 
Justice, which received $1,000· 
Sr. Marita's Primary Day 
school was allotted $1,250.00; 
and the Notre Dame Legal Aid 
Student Services Division, 
which will be given $100. 

Other groups receiving funds 
include:Amnesty International, 
$200.00;Big Brother/Big Sister, 
$500.00CILA, $1,800.00; Coun­
cil for the Retarded, $1, 500; 
World Hunger Coalition, 
$400.00; Neighborhood Help 
Program, $1,500.00; Justice 
and Peace Center, $750.00; and 

• 

[continued from page 1.] 

Fr. David R. Jenky, rector of 
Sacred Heart Church speculat­
ed. that one of the reasons for 
the lack of an organized trip 
from Notre Dame was the 
proxim:ty of Chicago to the 
campus. "I know some people 
who wi~I. be gio!lg up by priv~te 
~eans, he satd. 

Another reason why a trip 
wasn't scheduled is that trans­
potation WflS arranged already 
by the Fort Wayne/South Bend 
dtocese. The Chancellory in 
Fort Wayne in coordination with 
the South Bend area director 
Harriett Kruell, has arranged 

the First United Methodist Day 
Care, Inc., $350.00. 

Members of the Mardi Gras 
Committee that determined the 
allocations are: Robert Morin, 
1980 Mardi Gras chairman; 
Therese Tavis, Volunteer Ser­
vtces smdent representative; 
Tom Hamel, Student Union 
director; James McDonnell, Dir­
ector of Student Activities; Sr. 
JudJtth Ann Beattie, director of 
Volunteer Services;and Fr. 
Mario Pedi, assistant director 
of Student Activities. 

Explaining the distribution of 
funds, McDonnell commented, 
"Most of the grou_ps receiving 
the funds were affiliated with 
the University in one way or 
another.'' 

Morin stressed the availabil­
ity of fund for charitable organi­
zations and volunteer groups. 
"People don't realize they can 
get funds from us", he said. 
''If there is an interested volun­
teer group or organization, they 

• .. ~vfinistry 
for space on two trains, at total 
of 500 places. 

Approximately 330 people 
have signed up thus far, leaving 
the remaining spaces available 
only on the train departin~ at 
6:15a.m. The cost of the tnp is 
$7, which includes a box lunch. 

The price of the trip goes 
beyond ~my monetary value 
though, according to Bishop 
Crowley, bishop of the diocese 
of Fort Wayne/South Bend. 
''The pilgrimage will include a 
long hard day of walking," he 
noted, "and you have to have 
faith or you wouldn't do that." 

Those smdents who are inter­
ested in transportation should 
contact Mrs. Kruell at 234-
3111. 

• • • ElE~ctric car 

[continued from page 1.] 

operation, an electric vehicle is 
pollution free, extremely quiet, 
and ''will save a considerable 
amount of petroleum ·resources. 
Malone stated, however,· that 

use of the electric autos doesn't 
mean there will be less energy 
consumption. "We will need 
more electricity and we will 
need more fuel to produce that 
electricity,'' he noted. 
Citing that the use of gas or oil 

to produce electricity would 
obvtously be counterproduct­
ive, Malone emphasized that 
greater use of coal and nuclear 
power woul<!. ~e needed to 
generate electicity. 
Malone believes, however, 

that because of the present 
political and environmental 
climate surounding the use of 
the two fossil fuels, that no real 
advantage has been gained 
with the electic car. 

"It's (the electric car) not 
terrible exciting at the moment. 
It's at least five or six years 
away. It's not doing much for 
us because of the nuclear and 
coal restrictions," t, e- said, ad­
ding, "I don't 5\. it as an 
effective reliever of the energy 
problem.'' 
An Indiana and Michigan 

Electric Company official, how­
ever, doesn't think the new 
auto will have much effect on 
electrical consumption. 

............ · ...... · ·~'' ... : .. 

Mr. Allan Wickizer, I&M ad­
ministrative assistant, stated 
that because the battery would 
be charged at night, during 
non-peak :use hours, on an 
automatic charger for eight 
hours, the amount of electricity 
used would not be significant. 
Stating that plenty of coal was 

available to generate enough 
electricity to meet American's 
needs for at least the next 100 
years, Wickizer said that he 
"couldn't imagine it ')The elec­
tric car) would take over that 
fast." He added, "The basic 
idea of the internal combustion 
engin·e will not leave quickly." 

&?in~ club 
to hold 
meeting 
There wiil be an important 

organizational meeting of the 
Greater Elgin Club tonight at 
6:30 p.m. in the Little Theatre 
in LaFortune. All Elgin area 
students and Friends of Elgin 
are stron~lr urged to attend. 
Topics wtl include a happy 
hour, community service, dat­
ing se:rvice, and a downtown 
Elgin a.ware1ness program. 

can get a funding request from 
Student Activities.'' " 

Groups receiving funds from 
this first allocation are inelig­
ible to apply again for addition-

that there be no banners 
at this weekends football 

L----r--~ 

al funds. Forms must be game. Banners will be 
permitted for the 

national TV game 
against USC .. 

submitted by March 1. 
Morin added that a car will 

be raffled offf at this year's 
Mardi Gras in addition to two 
student cash prizes. Some 
booths are still available for the 
event. Interested groups 
should contact Morin at 7781. 

Que.' 6 Ca6fte 
9K6flllmt FUJicla Spedaf 

Ga Flllllt PeJU~t, i!'a 6Wt cued i!'a 

u atal.e at Tlce Ouaa'a Callie. 
Wlrellca yea wallf eel6 ~ -eu1lfl M 

~ ju6t CL rat e6 laedg. Texfuu 'FDCUit g~ 
yea Ike &lceea CUid euta fJca! ~ 

6'1111t kabt Uf, geed ~ .Cet 8Wl 

expeld afgfi6f6 give yea fJca! apeciol 

eaeiL 

PERM SALE 
SAI,.E PRICE 
COMF'LETE 

REG. $35.00 I 

!~~~!2!~D~A~ PERM s2soo 
~~-~~!0 FOAM PERM s3ooo 
3. ZOTO PERM s2oso 

ONLY FIVE MINUlES FROM CAMPUS! 

, .• .... ' ' ... - . - " ~ 

272-8471 
272-0312 

We Welcome New Customers 
Fret! Lighted Parking 

~ -(Open Evt>:ningsfor YourConvenieiiCl') 

Tues.-Wed 8:J.0..6:00 
Thurs.-Fri. 8:30-8:30 
Saturday 8:30.:~:30 

Hi9k IJ'Iim 011e u guG'IIUifa te., qualify. 

Be a wiae abppet, t.1111fJ0U p'lim. 

Dea't pag IIIIJII, ul get fall 

~ ._..,.., .... . '-· ......... -~ 
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The Observer - SportsBoard 

Baseball 
NATIONAL LEAGUE 

East 
w L Pn. 

Pittsburgh 96 62 .600 
Montreal 94 63 .599 
St. louis 85 n .541 
Philadelphia 82 77 .516 
Chicago 79 110 .497 
New York 59 99 .373 

West 
Gincinnati 119 69 563 
Houston lfl n .547 
los Angeles 78 00 .494 
San Francisco 00 119 .4:rl 
San Diego 66 92 .418 
Atlanta 64 93 .408 

Wednesday's Results 

New York 8, Chicago 3 
Pittsburgh 10, Montreal 1 
Philadelphia 11, St. louis 5 
Atlanta 9, Houston 4 
Cincinnati 4. San Oieao 3 
los Angeles 8. San Francisco 4 

Thursday's Games 

GB 

w~ 
10Y2 
14llz 
17'12 
:rl 

2llz 
11 
20 
23 
24llz 

St. louis (Denny 8-11) at Pittsburgh 
(Robinson 8-7) 

Montreal (lee 1!HO and Palmer 1(}.2) at 
Atlanta (Matula 8-10 and Hanna 1-1), 2. (t-n) 

San D1ego (Owchinko 5-11) at Cincinnati 
(LaCoss 14-8), (n) 

los Angeles (Hannahs (}.1) at San 
Francisco (Blue 13-14), (n) 

AMERICAN LEAGUE 

East 
1 w L Pet. 

x-Baltimore 101 55 .647 
Milwaukee 93 64 .586 
Boston 88 68 .564 
New York 85 71 .545 
Getroit 84 74 .532 
Cleveland 79 78 .503 
Toronto 53 105 .335 

West 

x-California 87 n .547 
Kansas City 83 76 .522 
Minnesota 81 77 .513 
Texas 80 7f, .500 
Chicago 70 86 .449 
Seattle 6!J 93 .418 
Oakland 53 105 .335 

Xi:linched division title 
Wednesdly's Results 

Texas 5, Oakland 2 
New York 6, Cleveland 3 
Kansas City 4, California o 
Baltimore 13, Detroit 2 
Milwaukee 8, seattle 1 
Boston 6, Toronto 4 

ChiCCICJO 6, Minnesota 5, 10 innings 

ThuflllaY's Games 

GB 

8'12 
13 
16 
18 
22'/z 
4( 

4 
'l'h 
6llz 
15112 
20llz 
33llz 

Chicago (Trout 10-8) at Minnesota 
(Erickson 3-9) 

Toronto (Moore 5-6) at Bos1on (Finch (}.3), 
(n) 

Cleveland (Barker 6-5) at New York 
(Righetti (}.1), (n) 

Seattle (Dressier 3-1) at Milwaukee (Slaton 
15-9). (n) · 

Oakland (Keough 2-16) at Texas (Comer 
16-11), (n) 

Inter hall 
Football 

Last Night's Results 

Stanford 3-Fianner 0 
Keenan 6--Grace 0 
Holy Cross 6-Cavanaugh 0 

SOCCER 

Dillon 5--Fisher 0 
·off-Campus 2-Holy Cross 0 (overtime) 

Fighting 

Tennis 
TENNIS 

The pairings lor all tennis tournaments 

I 
appear each Thursday in The Observer. It is 
the responsibility of the participant to contact 
his or her opponent and set up the match in 
each round. The results of all tennis matches 

' must be turned in, in person, at the lnterhall 
office no later than noon on the following 
Wednesday. Failure to report the results to 
the interhall office will mean disqualification 
of both participants. 

Men's Open [3nt round] . 
Ken New (1605) vs. Tom O'Toole (1026) 
Kent Brockelman (289-1718) vs. John 

Spenc:er (7735) 
Brent Beutler (17116) vs. Mack Fitzpatrick 

(1722) 
Bob Monzack (3313) vs. Chris Ritchie 

(233-5828) . 
Mike Hickey (1693) vs. David Mountain 

(3258) 
Dave Donnelly (7781) vs. lee Manfred 

(6755) 
Kinny McQuade (277-2120) vs. Ken 

Kadleck (3661) 
Mike Burton (1653) vs. Pat McAward 

(7474) 
John Eichenlaub (8595) vs. Bill Straccia 

(3336) 
Ismail Habab (1932) vs. Pat Navin (1651) 
Jim Somers (277-3275) vs. Jell Cook (1791) 
Kevin Simpson (3381) vs. Doug Stahura 

(3305) 
Ken Vllhite (3542) vs. larry Puntureri 

(233-9075) 
John Burke (8528) vs. Gavin Green (1757) 
Jell\1\/olfe (11919) vs. George Gaskin (7683) 
Patrick Rock {277-4478) vs. Mike Pierret 

(1814) 

Men's novice 

John Salem (3588) 'IS. Karl love (8657) 
Sean Cain (1605) vs. Mike Binkle (3574) 
Dave Callahan (1734) vs. Roger Morgan 

(3217) 
Ted Gutmann (3273) vs. Bye 

Women's singles 

laurie Zelmer (61197) vs. Jay Declo 
(277-5842) 

Eileen Rakochy (6885) vs. Pam Gorski 
(1257) 

Mixed Doubles 

Donnelly-Percy (3542) vs. Bye 
Krappman-McCarthy (11605) vs. Didier­

Bernheim (8007) 
Finney-Ferrero (232-{)384) vs. Brockelman­

Schmidtlein (7239) 
Cuzins-Yaeger {6868) vs. Dawson-Sullivan 

(8755) 
Maus-Kotak (3285) vs. Kilbridge-Berry 

(3312) 
Burns-Ritchie (233-5828) vs. Hammer­

Burton (1653) 
Kadleck-White (3542) vs. Mangine-West 

(6888) 
Ash-Wyborski (3338) vs. O'Brien-Rivera 

(8326) 

Soccer 
Wednesday 

NOTRE DAME 11, KALAMAZOO 1 

First HaH 

NO- Kevin lovejoy (Paul Devereux), 6:41 
NO - Bill Murphy (Kevin lovejoy), 10:13 
NO- Bill Murphy (Kevin lovejoy), 11:31 
NO- Dan McCurrie (Bill Wetterer), 18:57 
NO- Mark luetkehans (unassited), 39:21 
NO Mark luetkehans (Bill Murphy), 

40:44 

Second Half 

KC - Mark Koets (unassited). 11:47 
NO -Joe Ciuni (Jim Sabitus). 12:41 
NO- Bill Wetterer (unassited). 13:33 
Sami Kahale (unassited), 20:04 
Steve Kraemer (Brian Cullather), 34:48 
ND - Joe Ciuni (unassited), 35:04 

IRISH DEW 
Indiana 

White Table Wine 
PRODIIUD AND BOTTLED BY 

RlUNER AND SONS. SOUTH BEND. INDIANA 
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Softball 
Men's1&" Quarterfinals 

SMC athletic department 
Seeding: 1. The Balls; 2. Fozzie's Bears; to sponsor logo contest 3. Sorin I; 4. Chico; 5. The romeos; 6. 

Alumni II; 7. Fisher I; 8. Boucher's 
Bombers. 

Sunday's Ga11181 

Field 1 - Fozzie vs. Boucher's Bombers 
Field 2 - Alumni II vs. Chico 
Field 3 - Balls vs. Romeos 
Field 4 - Sorin I vs. Fisher I 

S!\1C Campus 

Faculty Volleyball and Social at Angela - 7 
p.m.-9 p.m. 

The Saint Mary's Athletic 
Department is sponsoring a 
logo contest. The contest is 
being held in an effort to find an 
emblem suitable for Saint 
Mary's College sports. 
All Saint Mary's and Notre 

Dame students, faculty, and 
staff are welcome to participate 
in the contest. Submit any size 
design or drawing and enter as 

many as you wish. Deadline for 
entries is October 12th. Entries 
can be turned in to the Athletic 
Department which is located in 
Angela Athletic Facility. 
First place prize is a dinner for 

two at the Moonraker Restau­
rant. Second place prize is a 
pizza party. If you have any 
questions call the AAF at 5849. 
Catch the Spirit! 

Ups record to 1-2-1 

Belles field hockey tops Goshen 
by Beth Huffman 

Womens Sports Editor 

Goshen fell prey to Saint 
Mary's field hockey team 2-1 on 
Tuesday night. The match held 
at Saint Mary's gives the Belles 
a 1-2-1 record this fall. 
Patti Meagher celebrated her 

birthday With a goal mid-way 
through the first half to initiate 
the SMC scoring. Goshen's 
Lisa Clemmer put her team on 
the scoreboard with a goal n~ar 
the end of the half. 
The two teams remained dead­

locked until the second half 
when Belles team member Patti 
Tuite scored to put SMC ahead 
2-1 for good. 
''Our forward line was work­

ing well together and we were 
on the attack through most of 
the game," commented Ann 
Deitle, who is currently in her 
third year as SMC field hockey 
coach. 
"We're getting better as 

we're playing. Unfo{tunately, 
we dido' t score a lot of goals, 
but we were in there and won 
it," continued Deitle. 

The Belles coach also com­
plemented seniors Bonnie 

Dillon Hall 
to staRe 
pep ral~y 

The 13th Annual Dillon Hall 
Pep Rally will be held tonight in 
the courtyard . between Dillon 
and Alumni at 8:00. The rally, 
traditionally held the Thursday 
before the first home game, will 
feature Irish linbacker coach 
George Kelly, the football tri­
captains Vagas Ferguson; Tim 
Foley and Dave Waymer, as 
well as the Notre Dame cheer­
leaders. All are invited to cheer 
the Irish over the Spartans. 

NER& 
is a lallily owaed wiaery 

eticat• to ,_.iag liM 
tOle wite. ..... ., .... , 

(litre n.. dus of '&4) 
locatu 

• u.s. Jl. i• Reselud 

Keyes and Kelly Sullivan for 
their leadership on the field. 

''Their experience helps hold 
the team together.'' 

Saint Mary's and Notre Dame 

Provided more time 

will meet on Wednesday, Oct­
ober 3 at Saint Mary's. The 
contest which begins at 4:30, 
will be a rematch of a 2-2 tie the 
two teams participated in ear­
lier in the season. 

Counsilman credits Title IX 
BLOOMINGTON, Ind. (AP)- A 
federal law requiring equal 
status for men and women in 
scholastic sports was instru­
mental in helping] ames "Doc" 
Counsilman break an English 
Channel swimming record, the 
Indiana University swimming 
coach sar.s. 

Counsiiman, 58, became the 
oldest person ever to swim 
the channel when he did it in 

131fz hours on Sept. 14. He said 
the federal ruling helped 
provide him with the time he 
needed for training because he 
was able to turn over some of 
his coaching duties to women 
coaches. 

At a welcome home reception 
here Tuesday, Counsilman said 
if Title IX had been instituted 
earlier, he would have swum 
the channel years ago .. 

Counsilman, who was the 
214th person ever to success­
fully complete the 21-mile trip, 
said swimming the channel was 
his teenage dream. ·._ 

He swam a total of 1,200 
miles during his ten-month 
training for the event. 

Counsilman dido' t know he 
would be vying for any world 
records when he began training 
last year, he said. The fact was 
pointed out to him by a sports 
writer only a few mon~hs ago. 

He said he hopes his feat will 
attract top-notch swimmers for 
his IU teams and promote the 
sport of marathon swimming as 
the ideal exercise for adult 
fitness. 

Under Doc's tutelage, IU has 
won Bi~ Ten championships the 
past ntne years in a row and 
National Collegiate Athletic· 

Association crowns from 1968-
1973. 

Counsilman said his 
excessive training for the 
channel paid off. 

"Frankly, it dido' t hurt at all. 
I've heard Diane Nyad 

complain~ after all her pony 
swims. There are no pain 
systems at all if you are 
psyched up," he said, referring 
to marathon swimmer Diane 
Nyad. 

Ms. Nyad captured headlines 
with her attempts to swim 
from points in the Caribbean to 
the Florida coast. 

She failed during July 1978 in 
her effort to swim from Cuba to 
Florida. In August of this year 
she completed a swim from the 
Bahamas to Florida. 

'.'Most of the thing~ sh.~ 
sw1ms are nothmg, 
Counsilman said of Ms. Nyad. 
"It's just so sad that people 
who are more deserving don't 
get the attention.'' 

Saint Mary's 
to sponsor 
Jog-a-thon 
The Saint Mary's Athletic 

Department is sponsoring a 
Jog-a-Thon on Sunday, Sept. 30 
beginning at 2 p.m. The two 
mile jog will take place along 
the path between Saint Mary's 
College and Notre Dame. 
Proceeds from the event will go 
to the SMC Fun and Learning 
Program for Children with 
Learning Disabilities. For more 
information call Mo at 5 797. 

• • • Widen the gap 
[continued from page 16] 

Braves - 9, Astros - 4 
A TI.ANT A (AP) - Knuckle bailer 
Phil Niekro drove in four runs 
and earned his 20th victory as 
the Atlanta Braves dealt an­
nother blow to the Houston 
Astros' pennant hopes, with a 
9-4 victory Wednesday night. 
The Astros dropped 21h 

games behind Cincinnati in the 
National League West. The 
Reds defeated San Diego 4-3 
Wednesday night and reduced 
their ''Magic Number'' for 
clinching the tide to two. 

Niekro belted a two-run 
double off .his brother, Joe, 
20-11, to open the scoring in the 
second inning as he and Joe 
became the first brothers in 
National League history to 
record 20 victories in the same 
season. 
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Lead 7 of 8 categories 

Wolves dotninate Big-10 stats 
GRACE HALL Invites you to the 

BAR~B-Q EXTRAVAGANZA 
CHICAGO (AP)- Michigan may game to 406.3 for Michigan 
not be playing up to Coach Bo State and have scored 32.7 
Schembechler's expectations as points a game to 32.3 for Ohio 
yet but the 11th-ranked Wolver- State. 
mes dominate the Big Ten in Purdue is the team passing 
all-games statistics. leader with 2~i 1. 7 yards a game 
Michigan leads in seven of the to 197.0 for mnnemp Michigan 

eight categories listed. The State. 
Wolverines are first in phases Ohio Smte's Art Schlichter is 
of defense. They have allowed the individual leader in total 
86.3 rushing yards a game to offense with 223.0 yards a game 
103.7 for second place Michi- to 201.0 for Purdue's Mark 
gan State; they have given up Hetcfnann followed by Bert 
71.0 passing yards per game to Vaughn of Michigan State at 
125.3 for second place Mione- 189.0 yards a.nd Tim Lifford of 
sota; they have allowed 157.3 Indiana with L86.7. 
total yards a game to 287.3 for Steve Smith of Michigan State 
runnemp Michigan State and has taken over the rushing lead. 
they have allowed 8. 7 points a Smith is averaging 102.7 yards 
game to 16.3 for Indiana. to 101.7 for Garry White of 

Michigan leads in rushing by Minnesota and 100.7 for Mike 
gaining 255.3 yards a game to Holmes of Illinois. 
23 7. 3 for second place Ohio Herrmann is the passing lead­
State; the Wolverines have er on a grading system with 48 
amassed 420.0 total yards a completions for 640 yards. 
~~~~~~~~~~· 

• • 

[continued (rom page 16] 
''The first win is the hardest to 
get," commented Murphy._ 
"Now that they have done It, 
they are beginning to see how 
good they really are. I am proud 
of how the girls pulled it 
through under pressure. Their 

. ¥oileyball 
fundamentals are improving 
every day and that is what it 
takes to win ballgames. I hope 
this feelmg stays with them.'' 
The Belles hope to make it two 

in a row .. when they face Grace 
College next Thursday at An­
gela Athletic Facility. 

The Daily Crossw·ord 
ACROSS 34 Golf score 

Dairy case 
offerings 

1 Tricorn and 35 
topi 

5 Heroic 
tales 

10 Fellow 
14 Soviet 

range 
15 County in 

Ireland 
16 Stockings 
17 Soup herb 
18 Bridal path 
19 Whit 
20 Indian 

turnip 
23 Finish 
24 Force to go 
25 Ensign 
30 Most 

dreadful 

37 Musical 
speeds 

38 Prototype: 
abbr. 

40 A basis of 
state taxes 

42 German 
negative 

43 Department 
of France 

45 Capers 
47 Compass 

reading 
48 Spring 

flowers 
50 Prepared . 

gun to fin 
again 

Yesterday's Puzzle Solved: 

52 Smart 
54 Calendar 

abbr. 
55 Handy -nan 
63 Gem 
64 Pick up 

th" ta -, 
65 Bomt or 

limit 
66 Being 
6-1 Preva.·icate 
6d Harness 

part 
69 Meadows 
70 Put off 
71 Wingi'I(H 

DOWN 
Pilgrim< 1 

to Mec<:< 
var. 

~ Inter­
Powder ba: 
Smoothly 
i lgrati­
ating 

5 Obloquies 
6 Came to 

rest 
i' Dt..>ep cut 
r: C.ty of the 

Rhone· 
~- Qjzed 

2.1 --European 
22 Single item 
25 Damage 
26 Ankles 
27 Prospero's 

aide 
28 Admiral or 

guard 
29 Anguish 
31 Correct 
32 Backbone 
33 Having 

prongs 
31) Sown with 

·figures: 
Her. 

3':l Black birds 
41 Splash 
44 Nymph who 

loved 
Narcissus 

46 Tart 
49 Winnowed 
51 Christie 
'53 Cut up 
i i Grey of the 

stage 
Altar area. 
Place for 
a sala 

~ .,lant part 
59 °ut on 

-argo 
H D-~scendant'> 60 
1· P:aytl1ing 

[ shboard 
itt n 

1'' Ci•y in 
central 
P•edmont 

~~=~:.iii~~:i~~~ 13 Fuel 

61 Ja, .e Austen 
.novel 

62 Crystal 
gazer 

~ .. ~~~.------------------~---------~~~ 

Clifford is second and Vaughn 
third. after the Michigan St. Game 5~7:30 at 
Ray Smith of Purdue is the 

receiving leader with 14 recep­
tions for 241 yards with Dave 
Young of Purdue and Bob 
Stephenson of Indiana tied for 
second with 12 catches each. 
Holmes, Young, Dennis Mosley 
of Iowa and Calvin Murray of 
Ohio State are tied for the 
scoring lead with 30 points 
each. 

1/2 BBQ ~~cken dinner Stepan Cente~ 

S4.50 at the door S4 fn advance 

Morten Andersen of Michigan 
State is the kick scori.ng leader 
with 26 points on six field goals 
and eight conversions. 

Derek Hughes of Michigan 
State leads in kickoff returns 
with a 36.3 average and Anth­
ony Carter of Michi~an is first 
in punt returns wtth a 17.9 
average. 
Ray Stachowicz of Michigan 

State is the punting leader with 
a 43.2 average to 42.9 for Tom 
Orosz of Ohio State and B•llt<ay 
of Purdue is the interception 
leader with three. 

' • • 
• 

LIVI~ENTERTAINMENT 

CAmPUS KENNEDY 80 
CAmPAIGN 

Organizational meeting tonight 

9 pm Little Theatre 
LaFortune 

fot info CQII P(lul Lewis 8451 

TUNES CITY PROMOTIONS 
PROUDLY PRESENTS 

IDAY, SEPTEMBER 28, 1979 
MORRIS CIVIC AUDITORIUM 

TICKETS: $5.50 ADVANCE. $6.50 DAY OF SHOW 
AVAILABLE AT MORAIS CIVIC AUDITORIUM BOX OFFICE 

AND RIVER CITY RECORDS. U.S. 31 NORTH 
ELKHART: SUSPENDED CHORD. PIERRE MORAN MALL 

NILES: THE RECORD JOINT. BELL PLAZA 
MISHAWAKA: BOOGIE RECORDS. COLLEGE SQUARE 

AND JUST FOR THE RECORD. 100 CENTER 

• 
ATTENTION: 

SENIORS AND GRAD STUDENTS 
interested in discovering employment opportunities 

with the 

·-BENDIX 
Corporcition 

Reception · 
111ursday,Sept. 27 

7:00 -- 9:00 pm 

Blue-Gold ·and Shamrock 
Rooms 

.. ...., 
j 

·Morris Inn 
.r~freshments -~11./ii.:.s~roed. 

• • I • • 
• , 
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Molarity by Michael Molinelli Tri-captains 

Classifieds 
Polyanna (Suzy Leye51 · 

Thanks for the cakt:.. the dinner, and 
the celebration. It was super! (And 
thanks for defacing my door ) 

Love, Dime. 

Need ride to Pittsburgh weekend of 
Friday, October 5. Will be happy to share 
driving and expenses. Please call Beth at 
8098. 

Jim. Drew. and Joe are getting lonely. 
When Is the next away football game?? 

Happy 18th 
To a beautiful blue-eyed Oklahoma 
blonde. Guys: give Rose. this gorgeous 
"SMC" Chick a call for her birthday -
5476. 

To all HELMET HEADS! 
Go for the Big One Friday!!! 

Good L11ck 

Chicks, 
Eight is NOT enough' Go for more. 
Your "Puppet" 

Bryan. 
Thanks for the great blind date. 
Hope to see you again soon. 

T. 

Loubla. 
I'm still counting and I know more 

people than you do. 
Love, EBLA 

Rick. 
Happy Birthday sweetie! When are 

you, going to stop by the window! 
Your Farley Admirer~-

Jim O'Hare: 
Here it is. just as I promised. Love you 

lots! 
Your Favorite Chairperson 

Beth Huffman-
I missed you Sat. night! 

(Oh hell, 1 always miss you. l See )'ou 
Wednesday' 

John 

What can you get for a dollar? 
A dollar will onlv qat you the shoe 

strings for your ADIDAS ! 

Dear DUDLEY & NANCE* 
Happy Anniversary +2. 

Love Warren 

Lady Mintchip. 
blushing is red 
Russian Blue 
The Muppets don't miss you 
As much as I do. 

Kermit 

David, 
Happy 20th! Now that you're older and 

wiser .... 
Dusty 

Tony, 
Sorry I couldn't make the game. I know 

you knocked them dead. 
LG. 

RICKY BEAST* 
Happy 20th!!! Than:x for being the best 

friend we could ever have ... Be at Goose's 
tonite for a well-deserved celebration!!! 

Pam, Terl, Susie 

Would someone please do Joe Rodri­
guez's laundry? 

The Mod Quad is alive and well, and 
living in a dorm near you 

ELGINITE UNITE! Utile Theater-Lafor­
tune, 6:30 for all in Elgin Area [legal U.S. 
citizens land Friends of Elgin. All hail 
Mayor Verble! 

Happy Birthday Mary lull!! 
I'd like to give you a great big hug with 

all eight legs .... 
a friendly spider 

What can you get tor a dollar? 
A dollar will get you a pair of panties so 

it won 'I look like you struck out at the 
panty raid 

To all of RICH HUNTER'S KICKERS: 
Good Luck, Be Tough and get psyched 

for Friday! !!TAKE INDIANA! !!!We'll be 
there to support you!!! 

Your Fans 

attention all beautiful & preppy tamales! 
Friday is John C. Eischwind's 21st 
birthday. Those bearing gifts of 1) kisses 
2)hugs 3) or other stimulating gratifica­
tion must wear their IZOD shirts, tan 
khakis. and topsiders to be admitted to 
the festivities Friday night. A gleaming 
white smile is also helpful but nnt 
mandatory. · 

INNSBRUGKERS UNO FREUNDE- Es 
gibt ein Geburtstagfest am 29.9. Die 
adresse ist 802 Miner und das Fest fingt 
urn 20 uhr an. Wenn???, rut Brads (1198) 
an. Bier und Wein und alles ist kostenlos. 
Spass vom F ass. 

Diane. 
Thanks tor making my 21st the best 

ever. 
Jim 

P.S. Do you have any plans yet for your 
22nd? 

Jack, 
· The Teddybear caile was the Greatest. 

Even better is your thoughtfulness and 
better yet is our friendship!! 

No Jack - may all the best of YOUR 
dreams come true. 

Love, MB 

Bun, 
Welcome Back. I Jove you. 

Sluggo 
P.S. 6121/80 YAY! 

Again to the young Lassies from Eire 
Our Gooney's are ready tor hire 
Just say when 
We'll do it again 
Better than ever in Eire! 

JOE GILDNER ("Southworth") 
We've beerllooking for you! Call Mary 

5207 (SMG )tor details. 

---------------------------------------------i 
. 0 (\ e'~ Tickets for the 1 

~t;,'il~ e~ 1 

o-~~ 0o ~ Pat ffietheny Conceit I 
~f:l· ----N-;,v 9-a~m -;;p:n-~~~;,-· f 

I 
I 

6fJ.· & 
1\11 pO ~ui~ _ _p,~itie_!e_~g_u!_ 

Nov 17 8 pm Stepan Center 

will go on sale THURSDAY Sept 27 at the S.U. Ticket office 

(limit 4 tix per person) 

sponsored by the S.U. Social Commission 
~-~-------~---------~~-~-~~~~---------~-----~~ 

to appear 
at ·pep rally 
There will be a pep rally for 

the Michigan State game Fri­
day night at 7 p.m. m Stepan 
Center. The rally will feature 
Coach Devine, the team cap­
tains, the Notre Dame March­
ing Band and cheerleaders. 
There will also be a special 
guest. 
Theband will step off from 

Washington Hall at 6:45 p.m. 
They request that all students 
keep their bikes out of the 
walkways in the route from 
Washington Hall to Stepan 
Center. 

All classified ads must be received by 5:00p.m. , two dars prior 
to the Issue in which the ad Is run. T .. 0....._. office wll accept 
classifieds Monday through Friday, 10:00 a.m. to 5;00 p.m. All 
classifieds must be pre-paid, either in person or through the mail. 

Jack McCarthy (the Giant ) -
Thanks for the b-day entertainment! 

(We'd better not GANG UP on Pollyanna 
anymore, O.K.?) 
Polly wanna .ll1;ker? 

JAF 

I L0ve Gats! 
I Love Kittens! 
I Love Gats and Kittens! 

Nansters 

The ND/SMG Southern Miami County, 
Ohio [ND/SMCSMCO ]Club is now being 
organized! Call 8602 for meeting 
information. 

Tom Goedde, 
Happy Belated 21st .birthpay!! 

Beth & Patsy 

ABSOLUTELY FREE 
ABSOLUTELY LIVE 
Thurs. Sept. 27 
the HUMANS 
at Vegetable Buddies 

NEW WAVE 

Little Goose -
Thanx for the JD and JG. Whenever 

we drink or laugh we'll remember ya. 
Cheers! 
Bill, Curt, Jack (Rest his soul) and 

Daniels 
P.S. Go Sues! 

Campus Kennedy '80 Campaign Organi­
zational meeting, Thursday 9 pm, Little 
Theatre, LaFortune. For info, Call Paul 
Lewis 8451. 

Any Arts and Letters student wanting to 
be on the University Academic Council 
should call Mary, 1312. 

------
Brown-haired, sty I ish trash 
from Lyons, 

You bring JOY into my life 
6400- Sat. 4-6 p.m. 

Dear Cripple In 441, 

Rumor has it the Chicago 
Bears want you to try out when 
your ankle heals. 

John F. 
I don't like Bloody Mary's!!! 

GUESS WHO?? 

Farley's Angels -
Road trips with you kids are great! 

Thanks for the personal. 
-Tim & Kevin 

I still think Jean Marie IS prettier than 
Cheryl Ladd. 

-Tim 

-Monotheistic DOCTRINE of Reincarna­
tion in the Torah. the Prophets and the 
Gospels. Write: The Truth of Islam. P.O. 
Box 4494, South Bend. Indiana 46624 

Dearest Cathy & Suzie, 
Please accept our most humble 

apologies for our most regrettable past 
impoliteness and childish innuendos. 
Our affect ions for you cannot be 
expressed as they surpass the realm of 
human understanding. 

Devoted fr Eternity, 
Two Reformed Derelicts 

P.S. Associating with you is the ultimate 
"Big- 0" 

ATTENTION All SENIOR ENGINEERS 
CE* CHEG* AERO* MET* ME* EE 
Proctor & Gamble at Senior Bar 
Tuesday, October 2, 10 PM - 1 AM 

Now that Jamy Noesges has a new stereo. 
she can play romantic music to the 
romantic visitors in her romantic single. 
111 Walsh - don't miss it! 

Beast. 
Congrats on successfully surviving 

another. year. May your 3.9 never wane, 
you throat! Happy Birthday, anyway! 

"Cordially Yours," 
Scoop, JK, Sean, Gus, Pia 

Desperately need two GA tix for 
MSU this Saturday. Call 4-1-
5107 and ask for Sandy. 

It's elementary. He did not 
cross the trombone line. 

Boycott 1-0 
GO 1-C 

Paul Piszarski, Sec. Ldr. 

DOMERS· 
Creat a green and gold wave. 
The Lacrosse team has Poms 
Poms for sale before the pep 
rally Friday night and before 
the game. 

Frodo is alive and well in 
Valimar beyond the sea. 

Namerla 

WATCH FOR THE 
HUGHES 

RECRUITER VISITING 
YOUR CAMPUS SOON. 

Contact your placement office 
for interview dates. 

r------------------, 
' i HUGHES: 

I I 

L------------------~ 
Creating a new world with electronics 

AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER M/F 
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IClassifie ds 
Notices 

RPM PRODUCTIONS announces the 
booking of the band for the first lime ever 
in this area for your formals and special 
occasions. Call Jim at 277-1891. 

USED BOOK SHOP. OPEN WED. 
SAT. SUN. 9-7. ralph casperson 1303 
BUCHANAN RD. NILES. 683-2888. 

Dean, Del, Kevin, and Perry, 
You can't get rid of me that 
easily. Sarin is the final 
solution. 

LIBERAL PROTESTANT CHURCH 
wants to invite You to join us for Church 
School 9:30 and worship 10:45. First 
Christian Church on the corner of Eddy 
and Jefferson 1 mile south of N.D. 
campus. Rides available: call 289-2417 8 
am to 4 pm Monday thru Friday. 

Notice to all Bruce Springsteen fans-- The 
Observer is compiling a feature on the 

large number of Springsteen bootleg 
tapes currently existing on campus 
We need your help-- if you have a tape of 
the Boss live (i.e. from Cleveland, 
Passaic, San Francisco, etc.) or a bootleg 
studio tape (i.e. from outtakes from the 
Wild and Innocent LP), please call us at 
3207 between 3 and 5:00 through Friday, 
or anyt1me after 11:00. All borrowed 
tapes will be returned promptly. Thanks 
for your cooperation. 

tAttention All Logan Volunteerst 
In keeping with the spirit of the first 
home football game, this Saturday, 
September 29, we will have our annual, 
once-a-year, fun-filled Tailgate Rec!! 
Held outside on the grounds of Logan 
Center, there will be plenty to eat and 
drink. Also get ready for lots of singing 
and yelling in order to get psyched up for 
the ND-Mich. State game. Tailgate Rec 
will be from 9:00 to 11:00 on Saturday 
ending early so parents do not get held up 
in traffic. So be sure to learn the words to 
the N D fight song and come ready to sing 
'til your voice goes! Pray for good 
weather and we'll show all the alumni 
what a tallgater is like!! 

Our first dance is this Friday, Sept. 28, 
from 7:30 to 10:00 in the Logan Center 
cafeteria. It will be a "Welcome Back" 
dance featuring a live band. A guaran­
teed good time for all who come to dance 
the night away! Help is needed to 
decorate the cafeteria and that will be 
done on Thursday, Sept. 27 at 7:00, also 
at Logan Center. Call Ed at 3479 or 
Walter at 3066 if you have any questions 
or need any information. 

Forlle nt 
FOR RENT: Campus\ 
rent with 3 male stude 
utilities included. Call 

liew Apartment for 
nts.$100/month all 
Ken 1758. . 

GRADUATE WOME 
chance to move into 
Townhouses. twailabll 

N: Now's your 
the Grace-D' Hara 
l immediately- Call 

Pat, 8110. 

getting ripped-off, No more worriHs about 
SAFE. FURNISHED C 
2-6 people, TEN minut 

ountry house for 
es travel. 287-7018 

or 288-0955. 

APT. FOR RENT- 83<' 
Jim, 1507 or <'87-987:' 
$77.50/month. 

ND Ave. #10 call 
, or Mike, 8382. 

eptember. $77.50 LIVE FREE during S 
per month afterwards N 
call Jamie 287·9872. 

otre Dame apts.-

FOR RENT: 
anted to sublet Female roommate w 

campus view apt. Live 
$100/ month, all ut11l 
Kathy, 277-2235. 

with 3 other girls 
. included. Call 

Need a ride to Denvor 
October break. Willin'~ 
ses. If you have the r 
7915. Thanks. 

, Colorado, over 
to share expen-

oom, please call 

Please help - I m in des 
ride to either Harrisbu r 
MD. for Octob,lr breal;. 
driving and expenses. 
that way, please drop m 

perate need of a 
g, PA. or Laurel, 
Willing to share 
If you are going 
e off. Call Sherry 

7915. 

WANTED: Female room 
View $100/month 272·6 

mate at Campus 
244. 

Need United 1/2 fare coupons. Brian 
#8693. 

Roommate nee1j- 2 bedro 
32nd St. S.B. $92.5.0 
utilities. Call Andrea <~8 

om house 709 S. 
mon. and 112 

9-8176. 

NEED A PAFIT TIME 
CALLERS NEEDED. 
GREGG ZAFFt\RONI 234 

JOB? PHONE 
IBM. CALL 

-3747. 

Century Center Colonial Caterers at 
needs part tirne barte 
cashiers, waite1·s, waltl'e 
personnel. Breakfa!>t 
he I p needed most. .l\p 
across from entrance 4 in 

nders, busboys, 
sses and kitchen 

and Luncheon 
ply in kitchen 
rear of Century 

Center. 

Lost & Found F Sal or ~ ~e 
Found: An engraved St. Christopher's 
Medal. Identify it and it is yours! Call 
277-5261. 

Lost: Gold Necklace in shape of tennis 
racket with Pearl. Reward. Call Cindy 
272-4267. 

to whomever removed the purse from the 
Student Union Office: Please return my 
checkbook, glasses , wallet, etc... No 
questions ASKED!! [The Robt. Palmer 
tix are a B-Day present.] PLEASE! 

Lost! Gold Cross pen with name engraved 
Thurs. Morn. Sentimental Value, Re-
ward. Call 7854. · 

Lost: A brown leather-like overcoat in the 
North Dining Hail after the Michigan 
game last Saturday. ll found please call 
8565. 

Lost: Gold Bracelet Twisted Chain & Gold 
Circular bar. Friday between 2 and 7 pm. 
Call Becky 5n9 (SMC). 

LOST: BLUE BOOKBAG W/ SUEDE 
BOTTOM OUTSIDE STEPAN. IF 
FOUND PLEASE CALL MARTY M8403. 

Lost: Unlined tweed blazer at Goose's 
Saturday night. Please call: Kathy 2145. 

LOST- A Silver chain with St. Daniel 
medal. 3113. 

Lost- class ring ('80). Initial M.B.H. 
pinkie ring. Please call- was lost last 
spring. 7975. 

Lost: Whittenaur watch; gold, blue 
lettering. Monetary reward. 3434. 

Found: One woman's ring. Call 8921 to 
identify. 

My Calc. textbook, folder, and 3 notebook 
were taken from the South Dining Hall 
Wednesday morning. PLEASE RE­
TURN!! Very Important. Call Kathy at 
1822. . 

w and old. DC, FOR SALE: COMICS ne 
Marvel, Warren. Star Tre 
dar, Starlog Space Art b 
287-6920 evening and we 

k Movie Galen-
ook. Discounts. 
ekends. 

For Sale: 2 AmBrican ,ll,ir 
Call Ariane 6804. 

I i nes Coupons--

For sale; 1969 Nova­
Engine & body in great s 
to believe. Call eveni n~1s 

only 55,000. 
hape. Must see 
- Jim 234-2862. 

rrived! Official The crate shipment ha:; a 
"'peaches" record crate 
stock at all fl)ur River 

s are now in 
City Record 

locations. Great for bool;s, records, tapes, 
a azmes, plants or whatever! Visit 

. 50970 U.S. 31 North, next to Al's 
Market. Open 10-10 - 7 days a 

-4242. 

I have one~ ticket to sell for the South 
Car~lma Game- ~Reasonable price. Call 
Chns 4640. · 
----------.--·----------

HIGH MARGARET ! 

Have 2 MSU G l\ tickets for o~_price. 
Call Jack 1792. · 

Fly Home to New York for Br&akl 
Students from N.Y., N.J., and Conn.: PI~ 
1-way from South Bend to LaGuardia for 
only $49. Paul 1553. 

FORSALE 
Kris Kringle Spt:cials from Avon. Lovely 
gifts at low priCllS for your dorm mates. 
Free catalog an•j samples. 287-6920 or 
233-6581 eveninns and weekends. 

For Sale: 1 GA tiGket to Georgia Tech. All 
offers considemd. Pl11ase call Mary 
(SMC) 4238. 

Tickets 

BIG BUCKS!! I need two GA tickets to 
any home game. Call Dave at 8782 
NOW!! 

I need two tickets to the T ann. game. 
Please call Bill at 8444 now. 

Need 8 tix for So. Carolina. Call Mark or 
Mike, 289-6543. 

Help! Desperately need 2-6 GA MSU 
tickets. Will pay your price. Call Sheila at 
7924. 

Will pay $60 for two adjacent GA USC 
tickets. Call Mark 1478. 

DESPERATELY NEED 5 GA TIX TO 
TENNESSEE! CALL JOHN AT 3656. 

HELP SOME SENIORS. OUR PARENTS 
ARE FINALLY COMING TO ND AND 
WE NEED MSU GA TIX WILL PAY OUR 
SR. BAR MONEY!! CALL DAN OR 
JOHN at #3322. 

I NEED YOU!! ... to sell me one Michigan 
State ticket-- student or GA. Please call 
Debbie at 6888. 

I rea.lly need 3-4 MSU tix. 
PLEASE- call Diane #7906!! 

(G.A.) 

Need GAs to any home games. Call 
4-1-5710. 

$$$NEED 2-4 GA TIX TO ANY HOME 
GAME. ESPECIALLY MSU. CALL PAT 
AT 1651.$$$ 

Need 1 student or 2 GA tickets for 
Georgia Tech and/or USC. Will trade tix 
or pay cash. 277-5261. 

NEED ONE TICKET TO TENN. DES-
PERATELY!! CALL MARY ANN #4-1-
4347. 

Need G.A.'s to all home 
games. Call Beth 4-1-5710 or Kate 
4-1-5220. 

$$ Wanted: 2 GA tix for 2 CSC nuns. 
Either Navy or South Carolina. Ann 
277-4976 

Need 1 ticket for Michigan State (G.A. or 
student]. Call Ann 277-4976. 

Desperately need 1 student tix to Mich. 
State game Call Monica 4-1-4155 

Senior from last year is homesick for 
campus. P!ease help her by selling her a 
t1x to the first home game. Call her sister 
at 4-1-4161. · 

MY BROTHER IS DYING! HIS LAST 
REQUEST IS TO SEE THE ND-MSU 
GAME. NEEDS ONLY 2 GA TICKETS. 
CALL KEVIN at 1608. 

NEED 1 STUDENT GA. TECH TICKET. 
CALL 1771. · 

Need several GA tickets for Clemson 
Tennesee games. Call 1771. You name 
the price, I 'II pay if right. 

COUSIN FROM AUSTRALIA WANTS 
TO SEE FOOTBALL Prefers to see 
Southern Cal. Will pay in American 
Dollars. Keep Cousin Cedrick from being 
Bummed. Mick- 8212. 

Need two GA Michigan State tickets. 
Willing to trade Student USC and/or 
South Carolina Tix or pay big bucks. 
CaiiChris 1905. 

Not coming back for Oct. 27 game at the 
end of break? Sell me your ticket!! 1 need 
one GA and ?S man student tix as you 
can spare. Will pay~! Call Megan 4153 
or 4161 at SMC. 

Two Californians are coming for the USC 
game. They will have my hide If 1 don't 
get tickets for them. Call Susie or Teri at 
4825 (SMC). 

Going home for October break? Sell your 
USC tix to 2 SMC ladies. We need 2 GA 
tix and 2 student tix. Willing to pay your 
pnce. Call 4349 (SMC) Cathy or Leslie. 

$$$$Need 2-4 GA tickets to any home 
game-- especially MSU. Call Pat at 1651. 

Need 2 Michigan State G.A. tickets. Call 
Mike 1748. 

Need G.A. tickets to Georgia Tech. Call 
Joe 8694. 

Need Michigan St. tickets. Call John 
1851. 

I will do anything for student and/or GA 
tix to MSU and/or USC - PLEASE! Call 
Steve 8696 Soon! 

Need one U.S.C. G.A. ... a Ia briefly! Call 
Don 8762. 

Desperately need 8 GA or student tickets 
to Georgia Tech. Call Eric 1384. 

Need 3 GA tickets to MSU. Libby 8082. 
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Need 2 USC GA tix will pay forty dollars 
per ticket or beat any other off11rs. Call 
Jack- 8700. 

Need two Georgia Tech Tickets-- Please-
will pay top$. Call Ahab at 8857. 

Help! Desperately need any number of 
M.S.U. tickets. Call Mike or Jim. 
234-6348. 

Desperately need 4 M.S.U. tickets. Call 
Kathy 4-1-5764. 

HAVE TICKETS? WILL PAY$$$ 1 or 2 
GA ANY HOME GAMES. CALL 7267 
JACK/. ' 

NEED 1 GA USC ticket!! Call Dan 8387. 

Attemtion: Will trade 1 studl!nt USC 
ticket for any 2 Badly needed MSU Tix. 
Terms Negotiable. Rose 4037 (SMC). 

I NEED a student or GA ticker for the 
Georgia Tech game. Call Elizabeth at 
(SMC) 5146 $$ I will pay YOUR price$$ 

Needed! 4 MSU General Admissions. 
Name the Price! Call "Miike" at 
"Goose's" 233-1115. 

Leg's gat serious. If you have 4 MSU 
GA's, then I have the money y11u want. 
Call Jeff 8764. 

Will pay good$$$ for NC-MSU tickets. 
287·2268, 8pm - 10pm. 

Hey People! I only neeu 1 U.S.C. ticket. 
Call Tom at 3661 anytime. 

Desperatj!ly NEED Georgia Tecl~ tickets 
Call Dick 1224. 

Need 4 GA tix for any game: except 
Carolina 3641. 

Help! I will be castra:ed if 1 do not have 4 
MSU tickets by Saturday. Call 3276. 

In desr.erate need of three student MSU 
tix. Willing to negotiate USC, SC: tix and 
cash. Call Bob at 3230. 

Wanted: 3 or 4 GA tickets to any home 
football game. Will pay good money!! 
41-5195. 

WANTED: ANY NUMBER OF GA USC 
TIX; Name your price. Cindy 8mi5. 

HELP! Without tix, 2 "HTHs" won't 
come. Need 1 Student or GA tix !'or both 
MSU & Georgia Tech. Call Rich or Mitch 
at 6721. 

PLEASE HELP ME 1 JT. Need i! Mk:h. 
St. tix call altar 11 J'h. Fran 8113 .. 

For Exchange - Wi II Trade 2 Southern Cal 
Student Tix for 2 Ga. Tech GA tix. Call 
Bill or Dave 272-1208. 

$40 For 2 Mich. St. Tickets. Call Mary at 
4-1-4708. 

Will Trade 4 GA's to Georgia Tech for 4 
GA's to MSU. Call Jeff 8764. 

Need GA tickets for Southern Cal game. 
Will pay big bucks. Call Jane 283-8012. 

·--
BADLY NEED AT LEAST 6 MSU GA 
TIX. WILL BE SHIPPED TO IRAN IF I 
DON'T GET THEM. CALL 8648 ASK 
FOR PAT. 

NED NEEDS 2-4 GA TICKETS FOR 
MSU. MR. & MRS. NED ARE COMING 
DOWN. WILL PAY GOOD. 8897. 

-Need 3 4 MSU GA t1x. Desperate. Call 
Kathy (SMC) 4776. 

Need 2 or 3 tix to M.S.U. game. Linda 
14796 (SMC). 

Help! I need one MSU ticket [GA or 
student] Call Mary, 6868. 

Help me help my grandparents- s;ell me 
2 GA tlx for GEORGIA TECH! Zlm -
4664. 

Wanted 2 GA Michigan State Tickets. 
Please Call Patty at 6874. 

WANT A DATE? I HAVE 3 SliSTERS 
WHO NEED 3 TICKETS TO GEORGIA 
AND 1 TO USC STUDENT OR GA -JOE 
-1205. 
Two poor girls desperate to go home early 
for Oct. break must unload 2 USC student 
tickets. Best offer for either one or the 
pair. Maureen 5224 (SMC) Kat1l 5220 
(SMC). 

Have 2 MSU GA tickets for best price. 
Call Jack 1792. 

Fly Home to New York for Break! 
Students from N.Y., N.J., and Conn.: Fly 
1-way from South Bend to LaGuardia for 
only $49. Paul1553. 

NEED 1 to 3 MICHIGAN STATE TICK­
ETS. CALL 1895. 

.. 

Need 2 tix to the USC game. Call collect 
in evening (303) 722-9921. '70 Alumnus. 

NEED 2 GA TIX FOR M.S.U GAME 
WILL PAY. CALL HERMAN 233-4972. 

Need one GA or Student tix to Georgia 
Tech. Please call Jake #3180 

NEED 2 GA TIX FOR MICH ST. CALL 
JIM: 1195. 

NEED: 1 student tix to USC AND 2 GA's 
to NAVV or CLEMSON. Call Don 1384. 

DEAL: Will trade 1 MSU and USC 
student ticket each for Navy GA ticket. 
Call after 11 pm - 288-2852. 

Need 2 GA tickets for MSU . Call Christy 
4-1-4783. 

WILL TRADE 2 GA. TECH G.A.'S (OR 
JUST PAY$) FuR 2 SO. CAROLINA 
G.A.'s. CALL TOM 277-2766 

The crate shipment has arrived! Official 
"Peaches" record craters are now in 
stock at all four River City Record 
locatio~s. Great f(ol nooks, records, tapes, 
magazmes, nl~nt~ or whatever! Visit 
RCR. 50970 tJ ~ 11 North, next to Als 
Super Markbt. Upen 10-10 -- 7 days a 
week. 277-4242. 

I have one GA ticket to sell for the South 
Caroline game. Reasonable price. Call 
Chris 4640. 

Defected Bolshoi Ballet dancers want to 
see American Football game. Don't be a 
Commie! Sell them two GA tix for 
Georgia Tech. Call John at 8951. 

I urgently and desperately (REDUN 
DANTL Y) need 4 NO-Georgia Tech GA's 
all together. You will make my family 
very happy. Call John at 1209. 

Need 3 G.A. tickets for Michigan State 
Call1803. 

WANTED: 2 tickets to South Carolina 
game. Call collect. 1-802-775-4553. 

·--
I need tickets (preferably G .A.'~) for the 
Mich. St. game. Please help. Call Brian 
3062. 

Need MSU tix. Call Tim at 287-4823 after 
6 pm. 

Need 3 G.A. tickets to Georgia Tech. Call 
- 4391. 

Desperately 11eed 2 G.A. tix to USC game. 
Wiii!J~Y ao;ulute top dollar. Call Frank at 
3092. 

Need Southern Cal tickets. Will pay top 
dollar. Call Joe after 10. 233-6024. 

Must have 4 GA tickets for Mich. St. Will 
pay your price. Call Rick 8698. 

WANTEDD 2 or more tickets, must be 
grouped together, for any N.D. home 
football games· Willing to buy at pre-
mium price. Call 287-3311. 

Desperately need 1 student or G .A. ticket 
to the Michigan St. game. Call Dave at 
6939. 

Personals 
I want to personally thank llarb, Mark, 
Janet, Tim, Jean-Marie, Greg, Carol 
[The Badin Bowler]. Jeff, Kathy, AI, 
Carol [The Misguided Yankee fan! 
C~~rle, and e~peclally Jim and donna fo1 
a Splashing 20th In Both Keenan and 
St. Joe's Lake last Monday night. 

Thanks! 
Mike C. 

A Message From Heaven 
Today Is Joe lncandella's birthday. 

Call him, 1873 
From, God and His Archangels, 

Michael & Gabriel 

DOUG* SULLY [YOUR 2nd personal ] 
and bernie, 

ROSES AND PIZZA* WHAT'S ON 
TAP FOR THE LYONS GIRLS TO 
NIGHT?? LYONS VS. BADIN TONIGHT 
AT 6:30 CARTIER FIELD. COME OUT 
AND CHEER FOR LYONS!! LYONS 
ARE WHAT? RED HOT!!! 

Mart, 
Bon Anniversaire! Comme surpris jete 

donne un rendez-vous secret avec Rich­
ard ce soir. Amuse-toi bien, cherie. 

K. 

Mrs. Kru, 
Have a great Birthday Monday. I car.'t 

wait to wish it to you in person 1 
Love, Dave 

Happy 21st Birthday Janet Caruso. 
Just imagine, no longer do you have to 

sneak into Corby's or Goose's! We hope 
to make it an enjoyable day - you deserve 
it! 

Love, TTT from the RLD 

j 

~ 

4 
j 

~ 
I 
4 
I 
j 
1 

l 
~-J 

l 



---·--

goaltender Lincoln the Insh at 4-4-1 enten'ng the 
McRnde can't stop Mark Luet- weekend. [photo by Tom 
kelians goal. T/Je victory P'!t jackman]. 

NL pennant race 

------- - - - ~-----~------------
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Preparing for Indiana 

Irish crush Kalamazoo 
by Michael Ortman 

Sports Writer 

Junior halfback Bill Murphy 
scored two goals and dished out 
an assist, and Joe Ciuni and 
Mark Luetkehans added two 
goals a piece as the Notre Dame 
soccer team embarrassed visi­
ing Kalamazoo yesterday, 11-1. 

"I thought we played really 
well for the first twenty 
minutes," said Irish coach Rich 
Hunter, "but we're going w 
have to keep up that kind of 
play if we're going to stand a 
chance against Indiana on 
Friday." 

During those first twenty 
minutes, the Irish built a quick 
4-0 lead on Murphy's goals, 
both assisted by Kevin Lovejoy, 
and single scores by Lovejoy 
and Dan McCurrie. 

Murphy resounded the ''Beat 

Indiana" theme. "None of 
these goals today are going to 
help us on Friday," said the 
jumor forward. "We just can't 
let up now.'' 

Lovejoy ran his team leading 
point total to 13 with his goal 
and two assists. The center 
forward has now scored nine 
goals on the year and five in the 
last four games. 

Freshman Mark Luetkehans 
scored twice late in the first half 
with the two goals coming just 
over a minute apart. Hornet 
goalie Lincoln McBride 
mishandled a shot from 
Murphy and Luetkehans was in 
perfect position for the chip-in 
past the helpless goal keeper. 

Just 1: 13later, Murphy again 
charged the goal and McBride 
came out to meet him. The 
Irish halfback simply dished the 
ball off to the waiting 
Luetkehans who booted it in to 
the open net. 

fullbacks Oliver -Franklin and 
Tom Crotty were at the wing 
positions and top-goalie Brian 
Cullather, who had been taking 
a day off, filled the center 
forward spot. Kalamazoo even 
sent in its reserve goalie. 

Nonetheless, tbe margin 
continued to bulge on a pair of 
goals by Irish halfback Ciuni 
and single tallies by forwards 
Sami Kahale and Bill W etterer 
and Halfback Steve Kraemer. 

"Notre Dame has a very good 
team,'' said Hornet coach 
Hardy Fuchs. "We were 
beaten on sheer value. We 
were never really in this ball 
game, and I don't really know 
why. I guess every team has a 
day like this sometime during 
the season.'' 

Pirates, Reds widen the gap 
With the 6-0 halftime score, 

Hunter cleared the bench and 
ju&gled the lineup. At one 
pomt in the lopsided affair, 

An Irish squad consisting 
mostly of reserves, will travel to 
Albion Michigan for a game 
with Albion College at 3:30 this 
afternoon. The regulars will be 
resting up for Friday's clash 
with lnd1ana, 1978's NCAA 
runner-up. 

Pirates - 10, Expos - 1 

PITTSBURGH (AP) - Phil 
Garner and Tim Foli drove in 
three runs each and Bruce 
Kison scattered seven hits to 
lead Pittsburgh to a 10-1 romp 
over the Montreal Expos Wed­
nesday night, increasing the 
Pirates' lead to 1 11.! games in 
the National League East. 
The Pirates, who cut their 

"Magic Number" for clinching 
the division title to four, took a 
1-0 lead in the first on Tim 

Foli's RBI single off Steve 
Rogers, 13-11, and Pittsburgh 
was never headed. 
Kison, 12-7, lost his shutout in 

the seventh when Chris Speier 
led off with a homer. 

Reds - 4, Padres - 3 
CINCINNATI (AP) - Dave 

Collins' RBI single capped a 
two-run rally in the eighth 
inning to boost the Cincinnati 
Reds to a 4-3 victory over the 
San Diego Padres Wedn~sday 
night. 

Collins' single came after 
doubles by Ray Knight and 
Heity Cruz had tied the game 
off loser Randy Jones, 11-12. 
Tom Seaver; 16-6; pitched 

eight innings for the victory 
before leaving the game for ~ 
pinch-hitter. Tom Hume fin­
Ished for Cincinnati to earn his 
17th save. 
Dave Winfield and Gene 

Richards had hit solo homers to 
power the Padres into a 3-2 lead 
going into the eighth. 

[continued on page 12] 

Old world football lives at ND 
Picture the scene. Red and 

yellow leaves painted against a 
blue, late September skr.. It's 
the Irish agamst the Boilerma­
kers. Purdue has just scored to 
make it 15-10 with a minute to 
go. Pure pride and nerves of 
steel drive the Notre Dame club 
as they march down the field. 
"Rico" Harper bulls in ... 

. I touchdown! .... oops .... try. 
Hut wait, only 4 points regis­

ter on the board. What sport 
are we watching? 

Well boys and girls, the 
rough 'n' tumble world of rugby 
is the answer. The Notre Dame 
Rugby Club is made up of three 
teams which test physical en­
durance on the pitch (synonym 
for field) for 80 minutes every 
weekend. 

This past Saturday, Notre 
Dame's "A" ruggers dropped a 
heartbreaking 15-14 loss at 
Purdue, despite a gutsy last­
ditch charge. The InSh had led 
10-0 at the half thanks to trys 
(worth four points) by Joe Gill 
and Nick Colarelli. 

What, J?ray tell, is a try, 
you're saymg? 

Imagine opposing players 
leaning forward facing each 
other, hands interlocked around 
shoulders in what is referred to 
as a serum. A ball is tossed into 
the center . of this mass of 
humanity. It is then kicked 
back through the pile to waiting 
halfbacks, threequarter backs 
and fullbacks, all of which face 
the unenviable task of weeding 
through would-be tacklers 

Mike 

Previte 
,,bile lateraling to open backs 
behind or aside of them. (They 
also have the option of kicking 
the ball downfield). 

Sounds like football you say? 
That part of the game is. But 

just try to avoid a 225-pound 
defender without equipment 
while attempting to ground 
(down) the ball inJour oppon­
ent's goal area (en zone)! Are 
you listening Walter Payton?! 
The ball MUST touch the 
ground or 'no score can be 
recorded (sorry 'Sam Bam'). 

What about conversions and 
field goals, you might say? 

A penalty goal, worth three 
points, is scored from a free 
kick awarded on an infringe­
ment. This week, the Insh 
ruggers held Purdue to only one 
try but the opposition managed 
three field goals to win, all in 
the second half with a stiff 
prevailing wind at their backs. 
"Definitely the key factor." 
said Jim Bowers, Rugby Club 
president. "We scored ten 
unanswered points when we 
had the wind with us." 

The kicking game for Notre 
Dame is smarting a bit follow­
ing the loss of first string kicker 
M1ke ABare to a knee mjury. 
Jim 'Z' Zidar (one successful 
conversion) and Joe Gill shared 
the duties on Saturday. 

' 

Gill, in fact, figured in the 
two-point conversion kick 
attempt with seconds left at 
Purdue. In rugby, however, the 
kick is always booted from the 
line where the. try is scored. 
Since the Irish notched Har­
per's try in the corner of the 
goal area, Gill's attempt was 
the equivalent of a 50yard field 
goal mto a 20 mile per hour 
wind, a gallant try that barely 
fell short. 

One facet of rugby is the club 
aspect of the sport. The Notre 
Dame clubs play city teams like 
Indianapolis and St. Louis, 
while still maintaining college 
rivalries with teams like Mich­
igan and Ball State. 

Sportsmanship also deserves 
overriding praise. What other 
college sports do you know 
where the two teams can grind 
it out tooth and nail and then 
enjoy a few cold ones after the 
game? Imagine Woody and Bo 
at the same lakefront cookout? 
God forbid! Iwo Jima revisited! 

Any group of men who play 
for the sheer love of the game 
deserve support. Maybe a few 
of next week's tailgaters can 
stop by Stepan Center Satur­
day at 10 a.m. and exercise 
their vocal cords early while 
they tap the keg and see some 
old world football at its best! 

SMC volleyball defeats 
Tri-State _for first victory 

by Kate Huffman 
Sports Wn'ter 

The Saint Mary's volleyball 
team finally turned things 
around Tuesday night with a 
well-deserved victory over Tri­
State. The team, however, had 
to fight long and hard for this, 
its first victory of the year. 

Saint Mary's took the first two 
games from Tri-State bv close 
scores of 16-14, 15-13. But in the 
third and fourth games, Tri­
State bounced back and won 
both games by scores of 16-14, 
and 15-13 respectively. In the 
deciding game of the contest, 
Saint Mary's rallied, and with a 
great team effort, won the final 
game of the match by an 

impressive 15-5 score. 
Belles coach Erin Murphy 

cited the team effort as one of 
the major factors in the teams 
victory. Another key to the win 
was excellent serving by junior 
Kathy Monahan who has been 
very effective at the line for the 
Belles this season. Pat Zanolli 
did an excellent job off the 
bench for Saint Mary's. Murphy 
particularly complimented Amy 
Terry who had a remarkable 70 
percent kills average on spike 
attempts. 
After the win, Murphy hopes 

the team can keep the confi­
dence it gained in the victory. 

[continued on page i3] 

The women's club volleyball and Valaparaiso. 
match was held last night in the . Tom jackman]. 
ACC against Purdue-Calument 

[photo by 


